
Please file this with the MPO agreement . 
 
Thanks, 
 

Donna K. Jackson 
City Clerk of Jonesboro 
Executive Office 
300 S. Church Street 
Jonesboro, AR  72401 
 
(870) 935-0305 Office 
(870) 819-7800  Cell 
(870) 933-4637 Fax 
djackson@jonesboro.org  Email 
 
From: Carol Duncan  
Sent: Friday, May 18, 2018 3:40 PM 
To: Harold Perrin <HPerrin@jonesboro.org> 
Cc: Donna Jackson <DJackson@jonesboro.org> 
Subject: RE: STEP Agreement for MPO 
 
I understand that….but my understanding was it would be taken out of the contract that we signed 
because of that, and it wasn’t.  So we still are potentially waiving our immunity.  I signed the agreement, 
I am just advising you again of what I verbally told you prior. 
 
From: Harold Perrin  
Sent: Friday, May 18, 2018 3:37 PM 
To: Carol Duncan <CDuncan@jonesboro.org> 
Cc: Donna Jackson <DJackson@jonesboro.org> 
Subject: Re: STEP Agreement for MPO 
 
The clause will be in the contract that the company who will do the work.   Thanks  

Sent from my iPad 
 
On May 18, 2018, at 2:50 PM, Carol Duncan <CDuncan@jonesboro.org> wrote: 

I received the STEP agreement for my signature today.  Apparently this was on the council agenda 
Tuesday night in my absence.  The indemnification clauses that I believed needed to be removed are still 
in the contract.  As I stated prior, I am not going to hold up the process if you want to move forward 
with that language.  I simply need to document that I have advised you that we may be waiving our tort 
immunity due to agreeing to indemnify the Highway Department.   
  
  

Carol M.Duncan 
Jonesboro City Attorney 
Justice Complex 



410 W. Washington Avenue 
Jonesboro, AR  72401 
(870) 932‐0917 (Phone) 
(870) 933‐4628 (Fax) 
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Confidentiality Notice: This message, and any attachments to it, may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and exempt from disclosure under 
applicable law.  If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that reading, copying or distributing this transmission is STRICTLY PROHIBITED.  The 
sender has not waived any applicable privilege by sending the accompanying transmission.  If you have received this transmission in error, please notify the sender 
by returning and deleting the message and attachment(s) from your system. 
  
 


