This bid will not be awarded at ime

of opening Al bids will be reviewed by the City during the next few daysfweeks.

Budgeted Amount $50,000.00 Opened by S A Kent Bid #: 2009:38
Tabulated by T Cooper Date: 08/26/09
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Section A
1 313 Realign Rail 15 % 4,695.00 23.15 $7,245.95 Bid Rejected $110.00 $34,430.00 $16.00 $5,008.00
2 100 Tie Replacement $8500 $  8,500.00 $126.00 $12,600.00] [Whiteout Used $65.00  $6,500.00 $125.00 $12,500.00
Section B
1 Monthly Maintenance & Insp $1,450.00 $2,285.00 $4,500.00 $14,625.00
2a 0-25 tie replacement $90.00 $135.00 $250.00 $175.00
20 26-100 tie replacement $85.00 $130.00 $250.00 $150 Q0
2c 101+ tie replacement $80.00 $126.00 $65.00 $12500
3 Reparr Broken Rails TF $60 00 $135.00 $140.00 $120.00
4 Raise and tamp low track TF $12.00 $31.00 $6,000.00 $15.00
5 Mobilization of Tamper $4,000.00 $3.000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00
Section C
1 Max response time 2 hrs. 3 hrs. 10 hrs. 12 birs.
2 Hourly Crew Rate Reg/Over 343.75/ 48775 180.00 / 270.00 570.00 1 670.00 325.00 / 500.00
3 # of people per crew 5 4 7 &
4 Charge for Travel time $200.00 $400.00 $218.00 $375.00
Part Il Section A NO BID NO BID
1 Monthly Scheduled Insp & Test $2,750.00 $4,500.00
Part Il Section B NO BID NO BID
1 Max response time 2 hrs. 10 hrs.
2 Hourly Crew Rale Reg/Over 80.00/120.G0 430.00 7 510.00
3 # of people per crew 1 4 hrs.
4 Charge for Travel time $50.00 $218.00
Bid Bond Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes
Qualficalions Yes/No Yes Yes Yes Yes
Bid Signed Yes/No Yes Ye Yes Yes
Addendum Yes/No Yes (2) Yes (2) Yes (2) Yes (2}




