

BID NUMBER 90.141
 DATE OPENED 12/1/14, 1/14/15

BUDGET AMOUNT \$

OPENED BY
 TABULATED BY

PAGE OF

DIVISIONS			VENDOR		VENDOR		VENDOR		VENDOR	
ITEM NO.	QUANTITY	DESCRIPTION	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL	UNIT	TOTAL
Street Dept			Black Rock	Boraham -	Geverly's					
		Grndt Gravel			Fields					
1		Crushed Stone - hot Mix	\$		\$					
		Fab Shop		NO BID		7.78		8.20		
		Fab Plant		NO BID		6.00		5.10		
2		Crushed Stone - Agg Base	X							
		Fab Shop		5.75		6.03		6.45		
		Fab Plant		3.00		3.25		3.35		
3		Crushed Rye Gap			X					
		Fab Shop		7.75		7.34		7.70		
		Fab Plant		5.00		4.50		4.60		
4		Manure spread			X					
		Fab Shop		NO BID		6.75		7.37		
		Fab Plant		NO BID		5.75		5.85		