

DIVISIONS
 Group Hospitalization
 All DEPTS

Blue Cross
 Blue Shield
 Blue Cross of Michigan
 Blue Cross of New York
 Blue Cross of California
 Blue Cross of Illinois
 Blue Cross of Indiana
 Blue Cross of Kansas
 Blue Cross of Kentucky
 Blue Cross of Louisiana
 Blue Cross of Maryland
 Blue Cross of Massachusetts
 Blue Cross of Minnesota
 Blue Cross of Missouri
 Blue Cross of Montana
 Blue Cross of Nebraska
 Blue Cross of Nevada
 Blue Cross of New Jersey
 Blue Cross of New Mexico
 Blue Cross of North Carolina
 Blue Cross of North Dakota
 Blue Cross of Ohio
 Blue Cross of Oklahoma
 Blue Cross of Oregon
 Blue Cross of Pennsylvania
 Blue Cross of Rhode Island
 Blue Cross of South Carolina
 Blue Cross of South Dakota
 Blue Cross of Tennessee
 Blue Cross of Texas
 Blue Cross of Utah
 Blue Cross of Vermont
 Blue Cross of Virginia
 Blue Cross of Washington
 Blue Cross of West Virginia
 Blue Cross of Wisconsin
 Blue Cross of Wyoming

Item No	Dept	Description	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount
		Duplication of current plan												
		Individual		58.79	NO BID									
		Family		136.88										
		Duplication of current plan with DX+L												
		Individual		61.04		60.00		73.48		164.30				
		Family		148.91		140.00								
		Comprehensive Major Medical			NO BID									
		Individual				39.30		62.46		67.60				
		Family				111.30		139.66		155.10				
		Term Life		2.20/mo.		.50M		.48M		.41M				
		Dependent Life		.50M		.25M		.29M		.48/mo				
		AD+D		.25M		.06M		.06M		.06M				
		Disability		2.05/mo.		2.50/mo.		.58/mo		.58/mo				
		Dental		* 2.29 7.24 2.24		6.00		NO BID		NO BID				
		Individual		* 2.29 7.24 2.24		30.00		NO BID		NO BID				
		Family		* 2.29 7.24 2.24										
		Total Amount												
		Other amounts												
		Other amounts												

Ind. 71.25
 Fam. 165.45
 are the same duplicating no. records