

ITEMS	BIDDERS														High Bids		
	John Drope	Richard Kessler	Indiana Waste	Jim Albert	David Nance	ABC Jorving	Ken's Quality Hardware	CSC Logrip	Morris Watkins	Carolyn York	How Bailey	Johnny Gibson					
1. L9000 Bookkeeping Machine															NO BID		01-100-2
2. 1980 Ford LTD (Blue)	201.50	352.00			50.00	201.88			276.00	400.00	527.00	101.00			527.00		01-101-142
3. 1964 Ford Van (Drug Conf)	50.00				50.00	64.88						25.00			64.88		
4. 1977 Ford LTD (Tan)					50.00	188.88	257.00			300.00		101.00			300.00		02-100-161
5. 1972 Intl' C & C			110.00		300.00							75.00			300.00		02-100-978
6. 1976 Ford C & C			150.00		300.00							50.00			300.00		
7. Front Loader for M.F.			160.00	10.00	50.00							21.00			160.00		
8. Valve Grinding Set					50.00							10.00			50.00		
9. Huber Road Grader				65.00	50.00			250.00				50.00			250.00		
10. Packer 20 CY			150.00												150.00		03-102-664
11. Packer 10 CY			175.00												175.00		03-102-685
12. Packer 24 CY			75.00												75.00		03-103-684
13. Dishwasher	60.00														60.00		
14. Refrigerator															NO BID		
15. Vacuum Cleaner (s)												4.00			4.00		05-100-518
16. Vacuum Cleaner (h)															NO BID		
17. 6 ft rotary cutter					100.00							12.00			100.00		05-100-377
18. Fertilizer					50.00							6.00			50.00		
19. Liquid Copier															NO BID		
20. Scoreboard															NO BID		05-100-501
21. Floor Buffer					10.00							4.00			10.00		

No check attached