
600 S. Main Street 
Jonesboro, AR 72401 

Donna Jackson 
Jonesboro City Clerk 
300 S. Church Street 
Jonesboro, AR 72401 

WRITER'S EMAIL: blacy@wilcoxlacy.com 

December 14, 2015 

Re: Jonesboro Housing Maintenance Code 

Dear Ms. Jackson, 

TOLL FREE 877-931-3101 
870-931-3101 

FAX 870-931-3102 

I represent a group of concerned property owners concerning the Jonesboro Housing 
Maintenance Code currently under consideration before the Jonesboro City Council. In that 
regard, I am attaching a number of letters that we have received from property owners in the area 
who oppose the passage of this Code. Please ensure that these letters are submitted to the City 
Council prior to consideration of the Code on its third reading at Tuesday's meeting. Thank you 
for your attention to this matter. 

BWL/sc 
encls. 

~acy 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
Tnere is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster .. The 
Adff,inish'ative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITIIOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city; increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the c?nsequences. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

/2,- /3,/$ Signed Name _...q.::;_.,. __ -., _________ Date ________ _ 

Printed Name ,rvl.5 

Street '\b:fl W~t'e~OJ.>'41\ ~DV'* 
City/State/Zip... j,;-wes:bovo J AR. -ZZJ{O\ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas , 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will ca~ undue hann and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. , 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable tines making a criminal of a citi7.en of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to co~ but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city,- increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqiisequences. , 

;. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a tine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citi7.ens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Street:---~'-'---~~~.u-.a....::.~~--~,..__._..;J.-~ 

City/State/Zip a o«·s 0o.r-o .Ai '1,:).,4-() ,1 
I 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcetnent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior {paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fowth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the posSIDility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

/. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name-:+-.~--'-;1_.;;...;;.· ..:---, -----Date ____ \)_ ____ - _t J_-_\S-__ 
Printed Name__._ ..... fdcP-.o~d......_...:..~--_f! ....... (i. ~ ...... 5 ___ . -----

Street ]_ '5 3. (_~\A<c."' S~ '\) 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigne~ oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner' s and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the co.nsequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines malcjng a criminal of a citiz.en of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs mn~ r?.~~"!frm. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
m1micipfllities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the e-Od~, L~~~uit~ 
against the city~ increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

;, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I 1.lfSe you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed pennission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city,. increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

/, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name [l;vvJl,J-VV ~ 
Printed Name ~ ~ Sm~ \-1/' 

Date lZ /l z.J 15 

Street 3'5[) l l2i J °:)@JJ4+1 GJu:j._g 

City/State/Zip ~j::1 19121 7 Z...4--01' 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the ve-ry people many are t-rying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

I, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior {paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

SignedName _____ J___..~---=------K,-~ __ . ___ Date 

Printed Name ]) i '1 g K tCJlf 
Street. __ (p_t).---"-J____.~......._----,;:-f/--~.....__.._..---'_ 

Cizy/Statel'Zip ~() A:12 1 ,;/(/t1) 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of th.ose persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees asseaed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners attd people oa fixed 
income, hardships on th.e elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
th.e cqnsequences. 

;, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcqnent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ~~ 1\ ill, .- Date \ "2..1 1 "2. / 2 o \ S 

Printed Name 'baxv e \ \ 

Street LP 2, Me\o Oj la,v, e__ 

City/State/Zip jb/1\,e s bov-o AfL -Z;;). L../-0 \ 
J 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citi7.en of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in con1rol of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

I, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citi7.en of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior {paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name Qoh Sh, &e'.\a 

Printed Name ~ o n10 .S /-t+PJV'A;,.J 

Street 17 L.ct W~ l{.x)Lk::.__ 

City/State/Zip , ) Q tu;? r;~/'t::J 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fomth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

!. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name aC,wd~a~ . .J Date rz - I<.., - / 5 

Printed NameL J' )\} d c\. L C\. ~ b:\PYb =-/ 

street~ o1f 'b\0v:aJ b r , 

cifyJStatelZipjQ:nesboco J ~ f..0..r-sci,s 7 d-L/ a f 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city; increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~N~~~ 
Printed Name r::3Ac-l(, ~ ~ 'b(f111 A:n) 

Street a< ~o { ~(2-A k__ ~ f 
City/State/Zip ~ o qJ ~ f3 o (l.fJ I fl;( 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the poSS1'bility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city; increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

;, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforceJllent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior {paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

r~"\--------------Signed Name --··--~ __ ___::> 

Printed Name Jo CL L' +r la 
street 1ee1L 0h,khA-./~ cJ, 
City/State/Zip :S-9 ~Jb()rD I A\(_ 1 L 40 ( 

Date I i Ii 3 l J '5 
) I 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are tcying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citi7.en of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

!. 

Section (A) 1043 gives the code enforceplent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citi7.ens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

SignedN~ Date l'l.· !3·1.01'.J 

PrinledN~-

Street J \Q \ d:: WY\1t:0'\~ 0\- -

City/State/Zip J"OM,S YJo ro
1
:fs;f2-- - 12--l}p [ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city; increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

;, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforce!llent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name r1tcJ.:rift&pwL 
Printed Name C/J.m ( S. IY\c11go r--J 

Street I ~ 14 {,J ~ Ct ave(\.- C-'7 

City/State/Zip :::1'~.£bt11,u 1 -ftL '7 cJ- if o I 

Date /c9--13-LS 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

;. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name _ ___,_~--'---)= ...... -___ --· _____ Date 

PrintedName ___ ·_·~_e.-v __ , ___ /'l) __ ov-__ s __ Ct.._._V\. ____ ~ 

Street i lR l Y w~ ~+c ~J'-ev"- C--"i -

City/State/Zip s~b~o \ AR 1)_t/& J 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the cityi increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

;. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforceplent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 
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chrismooreplumbing@yahoo.com; edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com; clgrehabman@yahoo.com; 
jwstreet@sbcglobal.net; johnsons3@suddenlink.net; ddover@nettletonschools.net; 
rennellwoods@yahooo.com; mtmccall@arkbluecross.com; tdburton10@yahoo.com; 

Friday, December 4, 2015 7:32 PM 

If you have not read the writings of John Locke, I highly recommend you do so. He was the political 
philosopher whose writing most influenced our found fathers and particularly the Declaration of 
Independence. According to him, passing the property maintenance code without the consent of the 
people is declaring war on the citizens. Please do not declare war on the residents of Jonesboro. We 
are a peace-loving people who desire liberty. Hopefully, if it comes to pass, it will be fought with ballots 
and never with bullets. 

Please either drop the code or put it to a public vote on a regular election day where there should be 
substantial turnout, not a special election where it is anticipated that few except those with a vested 
interest will vote. I comment the councilman who made such a proposal. 

The letter read by four "chiefs" supporting the ordinance was ludicrous. It is interesting to note that one 
of the signers was the person who brought shame upon the City Council by hiring the mayor's son for a 
position the morning after the Council created that position without it ever being advertised for 
applicants. 

Despite any good intentions you may have, this ends up being a "rob from the poor, give to the rich" 
scheme. Consider for example the man who was not physically able to repair his home and lacked 
money to pay for it to be done. He never did get a straight-forward answer about the consequences he 
would face as answers seemed to imply he could just ignore any fines imposed and there would be no 
repercussions. Anyone who believes that should start watching "Warrant Watch" and notice how many 
warrants are for "non-payment of fines." Any time the consequences of not complying were admitted, 
there was an attempt to vilify district judges. Craighead County is blessed to have four fine men vying 
for its two district judgeships, but it does not matter which of them gets elected, they will do what the 
law says. If the law says there will be fines, there will be fines; if it does not, there will be none. It is the 
legislators who pass the laws who bear the blame, not the judge who follows it. 

What good things there are in this bad bill could easily be passed on their own merit. For example, at 
the November 17 meeting, there was an attempt to make people believe this code was needed for 
vacant and deserted property. If we' need a code for vacant and deserted property, pass one. There 
would be little, if any, opposition. If we need a code for rental property, pass one that fairly meets all 
four of the following: tenet's rights, tenet's responsibilities, owner's rights, and owner's responsibilities. 
Something we do not need is a code which imposes those same things on owner-occupied private 
property. 

12/7/2015 10:11 AM 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed pennission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the CQnsequences . 

• 
Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paini electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Sig/led N-e ~~ Date_.,._l l_--'--l'l?:,'---··-=-zt>-~ _1'5'---_ 
Printed Name :E, ¥f:rSd< t '"I #Ja--,~ . ..J<-W ~ RJ fl' 

Street /[et, {p ~t~/./Av&J &1 
City/State/Zip ::Ja.Jt S13Q/20 /},z_ ?"b/01 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the .consequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior {paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

SignedName_/))._~_'_· _~ __ Jr,_. ~--'U.\L-' · ___ Date __ /_l-_!_b_-_).,_0_1~--

Street_w_._"-f_0 _~ __ S_o_-_L-'l_+_~-~-v-_o_o_l< __ D ..... r_,_1 

v_-..q 

City/State/Zip J O h -e_ S be, V',:) 
12-4DL.f 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city,- increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. ,, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforce!llent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

SignedN~~~L_ 

Printed Name h <?c ~.- ~ '.:Y:,: ~h 
Street ~.__\ \-:Q-\\~\ S-\-1 · 

City/State/Zi~{'\ ~k~ -0 ~\ ' :1?, '-\o L 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

/. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

1bank you for your consideration in this matter. 

SignedName4' IA;~ 
Printed Name G. ~ Y' t/4C!(u..JOJ-7t/ 

Street //eo~ ujy; 7.el-/4/~) &12 7 ·~ 

City/State/Zip 'Ji;:wt:5 l?dl-0 /JtL. ;µ/&/ 
' 

//-/~-201~ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

L the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

- II~ Signed Name ~ 
' 

Printed Name :J3, u Gtrid/5 
Street W,3 ~ 
City/State/Zip~~ , ~ 

7 

Date 1/-/2.-:JL> /.b 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

SignedName ~- Xv. .J{J:[a1,a 

Street L/J3 Hunfcl, f'f' 'JJtL, ve-­

City/State/Zip Jo ,1 e.sbo&a A~. /'fol </a c./ 

Date // · lol -.,2{)J S: 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city ·official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city; increased housing costs, incre~ed cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor andldisplaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. · ,. 

Section (A) l 04.3 gives the code enforce!11ent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Street o -

City/State/Zip__~ AR j 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city; increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

/, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforce.!llent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correC4 but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities hi;tve implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

I, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (pahlt, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

SignedName 1l_4~ :;:\.~c 

Printed Name Nov-rna :::lod.,,..Lij.; 

Street I 11 o Wil ~a.- Cr 

City/State/Zip J~b.ia,u, ~ -, ;>..':f o t 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correc~ but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the c~nsequences. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforce!llent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ~ ·,;;_;;t-·· 
Printed Name k f -:t j q l T { t" a T 
Street 4bo 6 ENGk (Zolli) ·~~~-'--...;;_~~~~~---~~=-~~~~ 

. .-:--
City/State/Zip 'J oV,tJ3 fSCb::, 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. 

;, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforce.!llent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Street \ \ ' () LO \ I IY) Ct V' C V 
" 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ___,O'--r'~LiJ!!-'Lt....._....(7--F--~------~ _________ Date_ ...... //_~ z_3_· _,. 2_0_I_S-_ 

Prinred Name ie I' I> 7~;;; fa A/ 
street 2 2 or UJU/1 

City/State/Zip -;:J;;tt1-e&.&:Xlo 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city; increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the consequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paiiit, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Printed Name L <JJ ~--------......,..--~~~~----~~~-
Street l/62 r s lA. yY\ M ,T lft'c!, £ r2t; 
City/State/Zip ~c1 J!l.fp S h (J \r O, fl/: 

7 
1~1./ot/ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines roalcing a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. Tt n1;;:-: .. :!.:. m.:,,,, •• _.-.,;.;:.:,,,, 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
mu.---iicipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

I, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforceIDent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Street ;), fl () (1 r ee_/! C ,/ 
City/State/Zip I N rf,r;f /JJV'O ,' Jv /2.J-/tl / 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesborn.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin pgerrln@jonesborn.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson fdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gva nee..@i.Q!1~.fi.P.Q.CQ,.9J:g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman cr£j.§b@sbcgl.9j)al.n~! 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870·~ ct I q .E/0 .51 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton !!;!burton10@1:ahoo.cqm 870-933--0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~e£~4& 
Signed Name Date 

S{-11ei 61 a1tkashif 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@ hot ma ii.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman ere/a b@sbcglo ba I. net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismoore12lumbing@y_ahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@y_ahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 

·-------·----------·---· 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration (~ s matter. 

/ 11 
I; 

' 
Signea Nam Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin h1::1errin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismoorei::1lurnbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@tahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5 788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 

oM ___________ _ ----------- ----· 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those p~rsons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

j 'J.. /I,/ /J~-J 
Signed Name Date 

1:/;> ,·t/ Ku;1 ti f Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at 9..@Ckson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreglumbing@y_ahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@y_ahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@y_ahoo.com 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburton10@y_ahoo.com 870-933-0884 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

//--/?)~S--
Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin h12errin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gva nce@jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreQlumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson iohnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

A. (\n \/1;1 /l '· \j) ,'"' AJ l1 (7 (} Digitally signed by Tosha Lindel II 
\WO/ u.L Cl) LI~. Date: 2015.12.1 O 12:48:58 -06'00' 

Signed Name 

Tosha Lindell 

Printed Name 

1205 Stonemill Dr Jonesboro, AR 72401 

Street, City, Zip and State 

12-10-2015 

Date 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

k you for y~ation in this matter. 

Printed, me 

3~1.f F<&t-Y!J'¥M±:: Gvt ~lii:te0ko, 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 

·---·-········--··-·-····--··-····················--·····--···---············-------···--·-·-·-·······-------------



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

OOLwk 
Signed Name Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin ~rrin@jone_sboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com. 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.oJ_g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 5;;ffl§bj§>sbcglobpl.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreplumbing@,:ahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams fil!gecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson ggreha bma n@y:ahoc.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover(@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rerrnelhyoods@Y.9hoo.com - 870-8Q2~4302 

Tim McCall mtrnq::all@arkbluecr.9ss.c;.9_m 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Sig~~ 
12-1-20,s 

Date 

Printed Name 

-
Nee~ d C)\QCSt:?OG>/ RR 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@Jonesboro.o__rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin tlP~irL@Lo n es bo ro. o .r:g 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson~hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gvance@jon~sboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman fr9!:l b@sbr,gjg_f?91.Q et 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplumbin_g_@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams i:..Qfil.£Offeeo_ouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson £lgre~@bman(royahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet..@sbcgloba I .net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson iQhn2 on~3(wsuddenl)nk.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover gdol(er@nettletonscri9.ols.n~ 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods r_ennellwood~.@:ifill9o.com 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccall.@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburton10_@_y_Qhoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ft.) £R0ffio 1 \:l-\a- \S 
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at.ili.ackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hoerrin@.im]esboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfriersoru..@hotmail,corn 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@ionesborp.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman frcjab@sbcgloba!.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrisr~mbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcgloba I. net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson l9l:!.n.~QI!~.1@sudd~nlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover(@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@~hoo.cqm 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@qrk~oss,_i;om 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburton10@J@!:loo.corn 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Lo~ C l>~~t-.-(_ 12_f'1f h1S-
Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

u~hl~ 
Signed lfame 

\{h-J-\~ 
Date 

:SO~\ WA,k 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
h !anted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

~~~~~eG-~~ther cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
~~~U~T permission. spection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 

'7.::::bf!:ff?:~~~s.s.cu:y--to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

6U4Cl4- ~- ?! 
Signed Name i Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7 669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Sig~~ Oat!;,z~z-/~ 

's.,..),Wes 5 Q/;:(2/¥2it! .L 

Street, City, Zip and State 

,Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jac.kson 
at ClliJ..ckson(aljonesboro.ocg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 
Charles Frierson 
Gene Vance 
Dr. Charles Coleman 
Chris Moore 
Ann Williams 
Chris Gibson 
John Street 
Mitch Johnson 
Darrel Dover 
Rennell Woods 
Tim McCall 
Todd Burton 

lu?_errin@fonesbo r oor&' 
cdfrierson3@hotmc1.il.com 
gy_ance@jonesboro.org 
crcjab@sbcglobal.net 
chrisrno.oreplumbing@yahoo.com 
~offeehouse@hotrnail.com 
&Ehabrnan@lYi.1huo.corn 
iwstreet@..;;bcglobaLnet 
j.Q_hnsons3@suddenlink.net 
gdover{i'J)netlletonschools.net 
rennellvvoods(!'ily_ahoo.com 
mqnc~9[1@arkbluecross.com 
td.burton_lO@vahoc.com 

870-932-1052 
870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
870-931-3178 
870-972-1365 
870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
870-565-7669 
870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
870-273-6795 
870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
870-802-4302 
870-931-7546 
870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ ~# Oat 

frinted Nam~ 

6Jo/ /Jl~6~Lcbv~ 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin h1;1errin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreQlumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5 788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

igned Name 
P/;1.d5 
Date 

R1--tnl\,,)n B-: (\,~c l\.kcrB 
• 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreglumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton td burtonlO@ya hoo .com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@ionesb9ro.o.r.g so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin !lru:rrin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson fdfriersoJ13@hotmallcom 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gyance@ionesboro~om 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman f!:9.§Q@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismoorep!umbing@'iahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson s:lgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstree1@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods renne!lwoods@:[ahoo.,_£OIY! 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccail@arkblu~.fros~&om 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburt9n10@vahoo.corn 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

1:1-q-1r-
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.o_r.g so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin ~rrin@jonesbo[Q&!:g 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson fdfrier§Q.Ql@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance rut.r;ince@ionesboro.ru:g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 5=rciab@sbcg!oba I .net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplumbing@y:ahoo.cqm 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams ~use@hotmail.con1 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@y:ahoo.com. 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson iohnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods renneilwoods@vahoo.com 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccall@arkb!.JJ.ecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton td burton 10@.yfilJQQ.&QlT! 870-933-0884 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

lt is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~=--· --"'-(2=-"'-'/hlt~~-<--=-'--~9--
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

110 3 (:,~ rPJ'l~e:, u. 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7 669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 

• 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of.these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

l~/10! JS 
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

~o _,)~ 41/k r 72 f{(J( 

Street, City, Zip and State 

·Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 

John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



I 

To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

lt is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

k you for your consideration in this matter. 

12-/j-!J~ 
Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 

Alf; 



I 

To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

lt is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~"- /~ /2-)0-)6 
Signed Name Date 

dtJ J./ N ,J !I J '; I 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 

4• 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

ur consideration in this matter. 

IA./J1/;s-
Date 

Printed Name 

4 IS ~I ~ A:f.._ 7~j'o I 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 

John Street kl?tree:~bt:globaj.ne t 870-972-5 788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Date 

Printed Name 

/[Q/0 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 
Charles Frierson 
Gene Vance 
Dr. Charles Coleman 
Chris Moore 
Ann Williams 
Chris Gibson 
John Street 
Mitch Johnson 
Darrel Dover 
Rennell Woods 
Tim McCall 
Todd Burton 

870-932-1052 
870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
870-931-3178 
870-972-1365 
870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
870-565-7669 
870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
870-273-6795 
870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
870-802-4302 
870-931-7546 
870-933-0884 .• 

~~ 
t)~·'c?/·~/ 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion ofone person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowne~s and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Th.ank you for your consider. at~·on in this matter. ~. n _,,,J/() Q L:owrLUJl.. _:; . , !L.- f (-1~ 
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

33\0~ 7 7 L( o { 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstr€<?t1£!?sbcgloba!.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

n in this matter. 

Signed Name Date 

Ke ,u ', +tJ Lew ,'s 
Printed Name 

9')_;2 :5. ?lif-R.rc/:_ :5+. :ToNeskJ01co ltf<. ff -:lt(o I 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street b;vstn.;@~cglo!Ja I .net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citiz.en of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

;. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcepient personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

, ..... , 

Signed N~e,,__· .......... ···_,kJi_~_. _~ ~_S'_ ... :_... -~-.___f-~_k.,..-i~--Date. __ J 2._li_J _1-.J--~-{ __ 
PrintedName.~~~~~----fY) __ ,'f __ ~h ____ _ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city~ increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the 00,nsequences. 

;, 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforceJD.ent personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior {paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thmst upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

,/' 

Signed Name-=~~~~~~..µ::1.&U:~~'---Date_.....,t..__;;)_-...... 1 ....... :a.._-__ l'"""'.) __ _ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. ,. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name "~ Date // ~ 2, 3 ~ / $ 
Printed Name ~ B £ ± ±j J-.. tp tie 
Street t/6J </ S'tm,rir£·J7e 0£. 
City/State/Zip~~- dft 7t2 l/t1¥ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqtJSequences. , 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior (paiiit, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

'') \ '12~~--' , { 

··""--' / j i I 

Signed Name k ~<~ ~-/ . ·. 

Printed NameiJkm /E Oi, l<.10 1'.J 

Stroot &do:~ ~bh) 4t-
City/State/Zip 7J.. YO 1 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to 
the very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to the discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons' actions. 
There is no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other 
municipalities have implemented code similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The 
Administrative Search is used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants' Fourth 
Amendment rights WITHOUT a signed permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on 
behalf of code enforcement undoubtedly will become necessary to implement the code. Lawsuits 
against the city; increased housing costs, increased cost on homeowners and people on fixed 
income, hardships on the elderly and poor and displaced homeowners and tenants are just some of 
the cqnsequences. 

;. 

Section (A) 104.3 gives the code enforcement personnel the right to come into one's home and 
conduct an inspection of the interior {paint, electrical, plumbing, etc.) and if the homeowner/tenant 
refuses, they then become subject to a fine. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 
against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name+?~ .J.. ~ Date_l__,.Z/..:...;/~w+-/..;...;,,l'S...__ __ 

Printed Name PA h--. L I TTL IE 

Street /lt I 0\ ~ ebb Cu~ ,?it/, 
City/State/Zip roN.-5bWQ f Ql< ]"2_~ \i 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. ) 

Md -~ 1J 1,/1c 
Signec(c)Jame Date 

Mv!v Aort/~ 
Printlcf Name 

tJCJf) f 95+ r:~<J lh~ s; tlUrt £Q J'oJJ§hoe J4 ) Zl/[J / 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street iwst@et~globfil.ne t 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Signed Name 

41,Ju 
PrintldName 

Street, City, Zip and State 

on in thi? matter. 

-/z;___ __ 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street Iwstng~cglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 

against them. 

Signed Name 

5ct:Jff-
Printed Name 

22!:?d' 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

ft is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in th· 

IJ/J I l- /I,. r 5,... 
Signed Name Date 

ll,11c.-e-Yl,/- .:r 6 0 t/C, ,_,. e-/ 
Printed Name 

7 2'-fO( 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 

John Street lwstree!.@2 bq?.lobai.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

/ilb~ 02~/c,'i 1,2;-! 1-;s 
Date Signed Name 

11/b~ro 0;?=yc_,
1°"-

Printed Name 

/ f ( l( & Yc~Yl5 ))or<?' ft~ 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

r your consideration in this matter. 

' (z(r, Its 
Signed Name Date 

~ ~JA.JJd~ 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~ Signeame 

fJ-/(-p 
Date 

Printedame 
/fr'11d/('y 

d1 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street n,vstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ ( . 
Date 

~?e!J~ 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street nvstres~bcglobai.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-f(}-75 ~ JL_, 
Signed Name 

rz-ll- 1> 
Date 

(l/lff f, q uc ~ le C--/ ~ ::> .5 i . 
Printed Name 

7Z40I 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street 1.Jvstr§et@.fil2.cg!Ql;3l.n et 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

r consideration in this matter. 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 
Charles Frierson 
Gene Vance 
Dr. Charles Coleman 
Chris Moore 
Ann Williams 
Chris Gibson 
John Street 
Mitch Johnson 
Darrel Dover 
Rennell Woods 
Tim McCall 
Todd Burton 

chrL;inoors.rJlurnbin_g@J,vahoo.co,,;i 
edgecoffeehouse@noj:rfl::1il.con1 
clgrehabman@yahoo.coni 
iwstres~fabsajohal.net 
iohilsons3J@sudcl2n!ii1k.11·21. 
dclov2r@rrettletonsdiool::;.net 

870-932-1052 
870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
870-931-3178 
870-972-1365 
870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
870-565-7669 
870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
870-273-6795 
870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
870-802-4302 
870~931-7546 
870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

1/h!L~ /1-(0·-.!S-
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesbQIQ.&.!]; so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin ht)errin@jQnesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfriersonI@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gyance@ionesbom.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreglumbing@_:v.ahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams g_ctgecoffeel19use@hotrnail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson c,;Jgrehabman@~ahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street J.l!ystreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson .iQhnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods..@:@hoQ.,f.Qffi 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.c.om 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton t!jburtonlO@vahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

ration in this matter. 

!J-/0,,_JS 
Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.q_r.g so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin !:m5:rrin@jonesboro.ong 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfr!§rso[13@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@ionesboro&m 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman cq:jab@sbcgloba!.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore fhrismooreQlttmbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson f.:lgrehaqman@_yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstree~@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover(@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.corn, 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecros~&.orr1 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburt<;:i.1110@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Date 

Printed Name 

3q-0 I towrl-(',r,q 0<A){s 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7 669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~L~ Signe~e 

"Wrq' i?,>wleL-

/2..-/D-/S: 
Date 

Printed !'lame 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7 669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

n in this matter. 

/o J)C-c I 5 
Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7 669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

tZM11~ 
Printed Nam 

P7 o:;IJeS 

c~?£L1e~Cevz 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at dl9ckson.@jonesborn.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7 669 
John Street 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

SignedNa~AaffApz:J¥; .,,,.,,- ~ M 
@A&.1< \J/ ~ l::-/2_2/3 ,4 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesbqrq_:.9.rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin ~rrin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson 1dfrierson3@hotmgiil.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gygm~jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcgl9bal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreplumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotrnail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson clgrehabman@~ahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson johnsons3@sudden]ink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover(@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@y~hoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtrncca ll@arkbluecr.9ss,..<;_om 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton ~9n10@yaho9.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

17 . /J/ ~ ¥a~·X!?:£ 
oigned Name 

~lt/ULE c5~T 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street Iwstreet~fac;e.lobaLnet 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

/'2,- Io - W ,'1:..­
Date 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street tv.rstnge~cgk.ibal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

/~- /0- '201.S-
Signed Nam; Date 

UoJJ S ~AJ 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 

John Street 1wstreet.@fillcglobai.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

ation in this matter. 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at dlackson@ionesboro.o.rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrin@jonf!~QQIQ.,Q[g 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierso[.1.l@hotmail,com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvan~.@jpnesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crci~b@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreg!umbin_g@yahoo.com. 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hqtmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson clgrehabma n@Y.a hoo .com 870-565-7669 

John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson iohnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover gdover@nett!etonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennelf\/ll_oods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccaii@arkbluecross.c;,om 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburt9n1,0@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

ration in this matter. 

Date 

Printed Name 

I I 
'124ot 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.o_rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin !m.grrin@ionesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson 1dfrierson3@hotm9 ii .com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gygnfe@ionesboro.or:.g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman gcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore ~hrismooreglumbing.@yg_!)~ 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgreha bma n@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5 788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson iohn~ons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yqhoo.com 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmcca l!@slJ:.!s.!;tly_ec~&.9m 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

in this matter. 

Signed Name 

i!>R.i-1+~:J LlcJdete 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@ionesboro.o.rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition . 

Mayor Harold Perrin .b.Qerrin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdf[ierson3@hotmail.~orn 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gy_ance@ionesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman .9:.£iEb@sbcglobal.ne1 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore fhrismoorep!umbing@.yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams ~dgecoffeehouse@hotng1J.!,fQffi 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson ggrehabman@~ahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson iohnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover(@ne.tlletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods ~{.oods@_yg_hoo.cQm 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccal!@arkbluecrfil2.&.om 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10@vahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

fd/i0rcv~ Dec uy~,:.r 
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin ti11errin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson ~dfrierson3@hotmail.cotr1 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvgJnce@ionesborQ.,g_r_g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcial;li:)sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore fhrismooreplumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hgtma].:£Qill 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson ggrehabman@yahoo.con:1 870-565-7669 

John Street iwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson iohnsons~@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@_arkbluecros§.,_co111 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburtonlQ.@yfil1Qo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Than for your consiJratio= in t~tter. 

;t/llf!;z_ a~ctef)V / 

Signed~~d 
Date 

Prin?e'd Name J 
/ 20/ J,t,uc)/?b ck %dJli~Jfd A/7x.~'Yb; 

Street, City, Zip and State ( 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.o.rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrin@jonesboro,org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson .9dfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.or_g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismoorei;ilumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson ggrehabman.@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@y,.?hoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecros§.,_g:.,m 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton td bu rt,;m ill.@.va hOQ.&Qffi 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Signed Name Date 

&11 f?o u/el/ 
Printed Name 

:::2.PG?A 8trrikey-,.t-l1!(;) :s;;P1C~t1rs M 72,YO I 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at giackS!Jn@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin h12err.l!l@ionesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gva11ce@ionesborQ,ru:g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crciab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreQlumbing@)lahoo.com 870-97 2-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotma il.con1 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@y:ahoo.com. 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson jghnsons3@suddenlink.ne.t 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@:tahoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.c;om 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10@vah.oo.corn 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

/Z--7-/5 
Date 

I 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jone~boro.,gJ:g so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin h12errin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotn1ail,com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gv_ance@jonesboro.oi:g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.niil 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplumbing@y:ahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeeh_ouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson ggrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street ~veet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover 9dov~ttletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods.@.Y..ahoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmq:all@arkbluecross._r;..om 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton~g.corn 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Sig~ Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreQlumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson clgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Jt>JC),JS 
Date 

Lex>17 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesborq.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrin@ionesboro.org 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson cdfrierson3{@hotrnai!.con1 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.Qr.g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman frciaj;l.@sb~lobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreglurnbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams fil!g~coffeeho_use@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson clgrehabman@y:ahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street t-.ystreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yrJ.hoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmc~<!(,!5bluecross.com 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Tha . for your consideration in this matter. 

I ;..-7-JJ 
Signed Name Date 

,Jovob! 5:. 
Printed Name 

·22-ta/ 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the Pty Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.o,rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrin@jonesbor.Q.&I.g 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson cdfr~rson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance ro@nce@lonesboro.Qrg 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreplumbing@.::.@.hoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edg~coffeehouse@t10tnlE.i!&Q.m 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson ~lgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street jwstreet@sbcgloba I. net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson l9hnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennell..\!;Joods@yc1hoo.£Qm 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccail@arkbluer:ross&,0111 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburt9n10@vahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

tftt~. CedL. 
Signed Name 

, 
Printed Name 

I I 2 Z St}n(Dlvfv 

Street, City, Zip and State 

__.J 

I 2 ·2-/.j 
"' Date 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at gjackson@jonesboro.g..rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hgerrin@jon~sboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson fdfrierson3@hotmail.co111 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.or:g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman s;rcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismoor~l_g_@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams ~dgecoffeehouse@hQtmail£Q.m 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson ggrehabrnan@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street jwstr~t@sbcgloba I. net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson jghnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettfetonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennell~hoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccq_u.@..arkbluecross&orn 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton1Q.@y_ahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~~ /)-7,(~ 
Date Signed Name 

{qEJ212q- :e L,t.lt LLt ~ 
Printed Name 

//2 7 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.o..rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hgerrin@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson fdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gy.fil)ce@jonesboro.oi:g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman frcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreglumbing@yalmo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams ~ggecoffeehouse@hotmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson clgrehabrnan@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street jwstreet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5 788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson johnsons3@..suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods ren nellwoods@ya hoo .com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.c.om 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton_:!,Q@yahoo.corn 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Date 

Printed Name 

'1,o/?? 'i,:hvq &,. Yl7m 1? ~.s [], ~fl<? 7240/ 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackso.n@jonesboro.QI.g so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hperrin@jon~ 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson fdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.ar:g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crciab@sbcgloba!.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore fhrismoon~plumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams ~dgecoffeehouse@bQtmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street llil?Jf_eet@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson john_sons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover(@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods ren nellwoods@y,g_hoo .,s;om 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.c;gm 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10.@:@.boo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Tha? fo~o~eration in this matter. 

/~ 
Sig~ed Name 

R~dJ~ 
Date 

Printed Name 

1&t11J J'~. N-11 ~b&a: cknJ.c/ 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin 
Charles Frierson 
Gene Vance 
Dr. Charles Coleman 
Chris Moore 
Ann Williams 
Chris Gibson 
John Street 
Mitch Johnson 
Darrel Dover 
Rennell Woods 
Tim McCall 
Todd Burton 

edg<~co ffeehv loc@hotrTic1 u.con1 
dg@habrnar1@yaho0.w,n 
jvvstreet.@pbce:loba l. net 
iDiHl30n33@sudden!i,l:;.ll2t 
ddovsr@pettletonschoois.ne£ 

870-932-1052 
870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
870-931-3178 
870-972-1365 
870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
870-565-7669 
870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
870-273-6795 
870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
870-802-4302 
870-931-7546 
870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs,_ hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

/fo ./~-/..£Date 

,_ I r;) 
;l_' ...:.....::Z,c...___£ __ 8 __ L.:-_,ts_P-_' _~_f_--b_/U'_ Street 

~ ---..;~'---'"-"""""'---""'---'=-~-~c.-..+-,-~---" ___ City I State Zip 

72 ~L 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs,. hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

T.hank you for your consideration in this matter/ '":.I · J t J. 
~fs;.iA!' -

~ ... ~ Signed Name //- /,6. ~,./~ Date 

£ .-/{] lflp-~ ~rinted Name 

-~-7_t!J-_3 __ <:-=-,.:...=· l:/_Y_· 1'"---'J/i=----1-~-- Street 

~ City/ State Zip 

~~~ 

/ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs,. hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

//-4-~oate 

_;:= L ~ Y }street 
• 

~-a 7.zie( City/StateZip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs,_ hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

7'~-
--=Sc...' ......;//.=:;,..· ..;::..'..S;;;__~,;_;_w __ £_!7_L_-4.-....;::' :......Y----- Printed Name 

Signed Name / f _. /J ---J 5>ate 

_J_3_(!)_"2._~_~_V_1i_W_f,,__~-~-~-·-- Street 

_ .. _:-t_~ __ __,<--~--...... l_fl-_____ City/ State Zip 

'?2-':fo( 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs,. hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter . 

...;_ ~#ur (J~~SOv\ Signed Name //- /t - ,/PDate ... . 

c...:_k-=-.,r..f-=-.:_5_1;"---'f~~ '7),__,'_Y_~--=\-"-""'L..JI• .____~=--ob(~-- Printed Name 

;;, J& 5 • f} < C ~YI~ ~d_ Street 

~p,,,,~""-L.:,=.,.l!'...-.j~=--=~~,--.,,=---=/y~----- City I State Zip 

7z'fe;t 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 

WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

J:?- 7- /ef; 
Date 

J?-7~ (t::;; 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin m:i2rrin@ljQXl'SSbonJ.O[G, 
Charles Frierson 
Gene Vance 
Dr. Charles Coleman 
Chris Moore 
Ann Williams 
Chris Gibson 
John Street 
Mitch Johnson 
Darrel Dover 
Rennell Woods 
Tim McCall 
Todd Burton 

edgecoffoeh0u,;e@twtmail.con1 
dgrehabrnan@)fahoo .wm 
1wstreet.@sbcglobal.net 
ioh,1sor>&@Audden!hiLii2t 
ddoyu@,nettletonschools.n2 t 

870-932-1052 
870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
870-931-3178 
870-972-1365 
870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
870-565-7669 
870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
870-273-6795 
870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
870-802-4302 
870-931-7546 
870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

;a-1-1':2 
Date 

Printed Name 

'ti{) I h c t£111 t tJ r Jt)J1L_Et}of'{), 
I 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. · 

Thank you for your consideration in thi? matter. 

~SJ ucr\ ' I .. , '\ . . ..... 
', ' • '• j ' •. ~ _ ..... -· . ....,>:__.jC.Lv <1:-

I 

Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

I Vr ,\,e 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Than atter. 

Signed Na e Date 

S tc. T Ynu ... ,r: 
Printed Nam 

\:M}V\ :b~lrvtwc 3ol\-<1'\~s~n AR 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Signed Name 

lou~cv {1v;ex 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

/ '}.- ?- ;..01 s-
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. · 

Signed N Date 

cf/:-efp!ll7if & l 
Printed Na e · 

J3o~ Ucarfe Cove IohcJ'horo
1 

/rt· ·7217)1 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

s2:!%f ~-tj-/5' 
Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf ofthe Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Printed Name 

lcfJ) l fredervicg&urg ttJ ~ lli.sboro 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

this matter. 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

/2·'-l·JS-
d Name Date 

!(£177..I ~~ 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

!(-1;r eh IJ1e ?J m Cl ;J 
Printed Name ~ - ~ 
~9X: J~ ,. 

Street, City, Zip and State 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank ~ou for your consideration in this matter. 

IJ)q /zot5 
Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Tz;;r consideration in this matter 

Signed Name / ~a;r/ /2-<f-/S-
Date 

Pri~~ 

Street, City, Zip and State 
72.//0/ 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Date/ Si ne a 

--r:;,,, fo~ !/mcucl 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. ~ 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

:Bncrnc1 O t l b1 tt I JJ__)q\\S 
Date Signed Name 

Printed Name Goo\ V\f (\ l \O.mSbx-·~ CVo 

:VCAesh:ec , Ae 1)Lf0 CJ 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~k ~ le?-~~;.s-
Sign~~ Date 

--SeJ-t"T_ G.-'<' a. n 1: 
Printed Name 

r2;Jo 1' 5hD 5hoYJ .. '1 Dr :SoYl e.~ bovo7 A~ ... 7ci<4:o 1 
Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at fljackson@icmesbgrn.ocg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin h genln@jonesborq,.grg 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson f:dfrierson3_@,hgtmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesborp.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab{@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore fllrismooreplumbing@yahoo.c;om 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@.yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street Lwstre§Lt.@),bgtlgbal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson iolmsons2!,@suddenlink.nel 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddovf r@nettletonschoots.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahQQ..&QlTI 870-802-4302 
Tim McCall mtmccajl@arkbiuecmss,i::om 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdQ\;lrt91110@'iahoo.cQ,,rn 870-933--0884 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

12 - R- ts-
Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin bQ_erriJl.@.iQnesboro.org 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcja b@sbcgloba I. net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrisrnooreglurnbing@Y'.ahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotrna ii .com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson clgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street ~street@sbcglobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.com 870-802-4302 

Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton10@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

/2.-lo-lS 
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition.· 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Signed Name 

C,br iS:>i e., lf i3h± 
Printed Name 

3'f6 5 (wo.r ~l ~ (L 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

for your con~;~on in this matter. 

6,L~ I i;/e;ds 
Signed Name Date 

'4-tJ I) 7 r912 F J 
Printed Name 

!ZW E. ~ ~ ff. I~ ,1/!. 7Zc/Cl/ 

0 l 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank matter. 

Signed a e 

r::tf\AA-- I\\ ~UJ-01.,~ 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hard·ships on the elderly and poor, and disl;?laced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

ffe_,,_i"'v1_· ~-b-~',."'---~-~..,...;..,--'f"--~------- Signed Name //-/7--// 
{ 

Date 

d/r9~~ 
~(/ 

Printed Name 

-"'°-<jo---+-f __ /_--<:_( /_~_+-___ Street 

·.,...--=-:;p_~n'-L<e~5-l,Lk.c_...Oc_~ _ __,A'---'---'--;( __ 7._Z ____ L(£ __ o_/_ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.' Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip .. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~C~<tM Signed Name 

_........C---"\t\~-~ ~----\ _c~~~Q,,Y\.G_S - Printed Name 

~l/~3 Y+--~~ _. __.___~_l C , ____ ' s _S_~. Street 

/, 
~~re) ,~. City I State Zip 

r'JI/6( 

I(.,. , 1-15 Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation;· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on thE: elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name I [- I ? - I , :5 Date 

__.&c....t·· ~T_._~...._,,l/"'1-----'5=-.L., __..C...,..;C)::;..._1-""'e"""----- Printed Name 

-1--Y~d .,,,,__5-+-;V __ /4~/ f~l5=_d_T __ Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Secirch is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, ha~dships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners ::ind tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name _//-I)-( J-- Date 

Printed Name 

....L--W,-v-J _17~· ---"-1!:-+---V/t--"-i S_J;_'i-__ Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the under;;igned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

·.·ery people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

. no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes simHar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

. permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased hou?ing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor., and displaced homeowners and ten.ants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you tc research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experiencec;f and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name tl - t 1 - J S Date 

'11-f-D n\..lt-5 Printed Name ----

_V\: __ YL __ ' ___ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

. used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

i~creased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced home01,yners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Date 

g_.L,h'-L2'-"M.,__V7._1/:i<..::' c.::..a.;._L~Ll.=.~.:::;;...l~'lu=----- Printed Name 

City I State Zip 



••••• Al&I --..- a;;.,o t'M 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

ld-f-11 
igned Name Date 

C-1t6dn E i/&rr~{ 
Printed Name 

lfJ-0 ( /_oc~Movr Uvtz~G}vre;, /tK /ol'f()( 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed inco~e. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and disp!aced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Date 

_7)~~~~1--,a.._(_._/____,_ftl_t~d,-~------- Printed Name 

_6_S";_~_fi{-"--. _/lt_,__f ,_~------ Street 

-~--~-s_b_~P __ A-r __ t_. ______ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increase:d housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

k~---=L __ Q_()_r)_()t) ___ Signed Name '\- l 1- \:) Date 

_\1--\--"'":)""'-~-=--C-=-_C\_;;...n_n_o_n ____ Printed Name 

--------------------· Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addres5es the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion ofone person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed bythe city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardship~ on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. : 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of .Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

() ,. ~ 1 

---"~'-'-'ll""'-a."'-"-'/,{~L_;;~u~a.a,J!e~~d----- Signed Name I,/-, ) b _, ) < Date 

~~1-+::0_,_/..L-, J..__""""'~~~..,_,}c....c;;(!y~----- Printed Name , I t 

_/_;}O I ,Frevzc~_ S-+~ Street 

1) lfa / City/ State Zip 
> 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

/) ~ q--JS 
Signed N Date 

Prin1!}~~1t Pu O / 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

b;lly &t_ 
I 

Signed Name (/,,.,! 
Pri~ 

Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Thank you for your consider tion in this matter. 

~ 
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

!'WY f,,J. ~. ~~ ~4 7-i,'f(!)C 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition.· 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition.· 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~fl-~ I). - '1-15 
Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

k you for your consideration in this matter. 

I 'd./ct/16 
Date I I Signed Name 

~"&QD ~('{\S 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition.· 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

ou for your consiqeration in this matter. 

\aj °'-I L ~ 
Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

T~u for your consideration in this matter. 

~lat D1(l)~ 
Signed Name Date 

Ca,a. moorc 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to Jive 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

s;gn~~ Date 

Uosh Yt1DD[f; 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

is matter. 

/)-/0-lf 
Date 

Printed Name 
7 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

onsideration in this matter. ,,.,,,,,,.,, 

Date 

Printed Name 

1'/ro S frtq,et2-r--- ~~~ !ft~ 7 ~ tO f 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Signed Name Date 

~Q\)1ld 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at diackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Oat/ ( Signed Name 

b )5'{ u"ti j 'J±{JuJ I tL a cl 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 
consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 
Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. -

Signe Name 

~Dk {Y){[bl);eJ 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. La':'suits against the city, 

increase_d housing costs, hardships 1Jn the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners a~d tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

.......__~-· __ Signed Name 1J=/_ {p /:)oate 

~ c__c.._~-~lk~ ............ ·,_h_,,_CA~)()~.,...~--- Printed Name 

~Jl---''7'---,4~8 __ _ Street 

:)o_n~o f}'iZ_ Q:;2. L/ 0 J City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip .. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

i.ncreased housing costs,. hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other.cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

8-""--"'"-=' (U""""""'=~lt.-ll::,L\-h~l'cl--Jc>-,--~~· .....,....·; """"='/l,4.\--:l'A00,.,__~-. _ Signed Name ·:.J r1 Lr' tr- Date 

0 1·\ ;\'° tUuti -+-~, TV 'Q ~ • 1 \ 

~ J ce; ;!J_s:~t c.~ 
~() ~D 'f\ R,K 
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Printed Name 

Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

ver1 people many are trying to help. 

Every1one wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elder~y and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~·--

,.../ 

l. \ _,/ 1 - -;;ov~ 
Signed Name \g ··- Date 

Printed Name 

Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

. consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, ~nd displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ #ia<rr--- Signed Name 

-Core~ Gf'<'.'.A-3 l Printed Name 

;;JJ,, :2 DC Yk,, r&d ;;:j #:-- 7f..1 

/~' 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

: increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced _homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Signed Name _j_lµfu//5 _ Date 

~11-.. lJr~'J~/!A_r:?~VSY},_____.._: a_l /_' Printed Name 

_/_/ o_J ~&.~t:.,(}-=--cb~sf~. _ Street 

-~{K:,,~5~0 ('o fl fZ ? tO{ f o / City; State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasorable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement beco.me necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

incre~sed housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowner~ and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

l urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

y~-ltb Signed Name \ \- f (Q -JS Date 

----'}a~a_fl-=----+-(l......,_(~~+.__:__,_{\_}6--'~'--{V-=~---- Printed Name 

JLQ)=------.;;...F-'--(e__N--"(""h_____,.b..__\ ___ Street 

. City/ State Zip 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

--+-~...:..~;:;....J-l....:;.:;.::11..,,.if.__\.-'Wb!W'"""'ta...aa...;.~-r..._:S ________ Printed Name 
I 7 ~ 
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-""TIJ_o'-'-n.,,....e:'"""'Si .... baro'----'~l --'f}_IZ____._.7a __ ~_cJ_I ___ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

) Signed Name //- / 1- /S--oate • 

_-Ji.....:....J1 ..... · fV\t _ __.., _j.;....:::.0._W==--'·e'--<r_)....__ _______ Printed Name 

-~-=-==tJ::....:..f\---=e::c..:a.,s"""'b=-=-oJl...c-q,_, _fJ, ___ R __ 7_~_'7..__0_I..__ __ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Councii for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Ever1one v11ants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. !t needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be taigeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to irnplernent the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased ho_using costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and t1:nants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Zw L . LL~------ Printed Name 

--~· ..... c'""'\..,_, ---------- Street 

__ jo__M5-6Q(!) , 4£. '72f/{4 _____ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

, Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.I Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results-have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants.fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessar/ 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and: displaced home_!)wners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

' /1 ,,. 
I (; 
V ' __ ,./: ... (. 'tee.... Signed Name ---'-/_/ _ ........... I ]_-_!_S_ Date 

A /, · . .....:c~""""e _ __,E""'_..'-----'-"q..._,5_()_,_/1 _______ Printed Name 

-'.....J""""2-'-(_0 ___ /l~, _h--'-/ · .... 5'--h_e_R.-______ Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implem,ented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

p1~rmission slip. inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixe,•.I income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships ~n the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thc:nk you for your consideration in this matter, 

Printed Name 

Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up. rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing cos!s, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are. 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

--~-~ __ t_-·t_a_
1
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too mut:h is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences.: 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ Signed Name 

----2.i~L> n~p~ Printed Name 

.,.---;:-

_______ JL~~a / &h, ~/ City/StateZip 

// // ~/,.CDate 
7 7 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and_poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased_ housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners an~ tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

____ ..Jl,ft!L"'-'WI, !.--' ........ ~--""-----·--------- Signed Name _ I! - I 6 · / s_ Date 

Printed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and djsplaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~¥ Signed Name 

----6-I'__.,~ ~'---"---'-~----'O~_}~_A_S_l_£_{_ Printed Name 

--""'-3_o_;a;__3_-_;J_o_R+_t\_M_A_' _rd_ Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessarv 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced hom_eowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ) /_, .JL-1£ _ Date 

Printed Name 

Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased ~ousing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and_ tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank 7ou f r your con. sideration in this matter. 

(" /l 
~~ck#a/k 

/~''' 

Signed Name LU ~-cr Date 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a d.isaster. The Administrative Search is 

· used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and ~isp!aced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

--1-/..J..£---l,L.D#D~f"-·-Z~·· "-'-"'JCJ.'-L..,_r-l..wf2"--""'u._J-=------ Signed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly ar:d poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

! urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-"---'-"#~t:-~-· ~---Signed Name 
_f_/ -_j_ (p_-_/5_ Date 

_/1.---L,.___.._{l--J-Cp'-----f-(l-lr-'..p ............... \ \/Vl'---S.___ ____ Street 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing co~ts, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants ar~ 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~-=,--=,.._,~_,,'=
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this. is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardship~ on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. : 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~(la...<:.J--'!,r~~~==------ Signed Name / /-/i:, -/Soate 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It ne~ds more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administra·:ive Search is 

usP.d in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced hoi:neowncrs and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced_ and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name 

Printed Name 

f)/J~O £ #.rJ __ S_o_N _____ Street 

-1-Pt•fhkd'o, f}Jz I;;/ '-I{) I City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elder!y and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects"Sfa maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

is matter. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includE?S the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It nEeds more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons'actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WJTHOUT a signed 

permission slip. lnsr>ection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, h~rdships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research \he effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you tor your consideration in this matter. 

-f ' ~. }} · ' _ Signed Name • 1 IJ_ a 11 Date ---4-~L-.. -' --~--- -J..L/.- L/.J_,_ 

Printed Name 
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October 5, 2015 

To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro, Arkansas: 

We, the undersigned, fully support of the International Property Maintenance Code 
as amended by the Property Maintenance Committee. The city of Jonesboro has long 
been in need of a maintenance code to protect our citizens from those who do not 
tend to their properties in a timely or proper manner. 

The city council has been investigating this issue since 2011, therefore, the time is 
well past to take action. We need to quit pandering to the developers and landlords 
that have received more attention than the majority of the citizens in our city. These 
folks have been fear-mongering long enough and it is time to stop listening to them 
and listen to those who of us have a vested interest in promoting and protecting our 
city. 

We fully support the right of entry clauses in the document and recognize that these 
. standards are no different than other rules of entry that are in our city and state 

statutes already. 

We are imploring you to take notice and hear our voices. Please give this every 
consideration. We appreciate your service to our community. 

Sincerely, 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents or, the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

_increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced home~wners and tenants c1re 

: just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

·---- Signed Name _}_,1:_ /~' D Date 

Printed Name 

__ 30L) C .-C.0:)~r_d __________ Street 

----~-Ofk;_%,_,_:r_72-=-c....=/O,·+ (---- City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is ctrUandish. \fife need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. !t needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed bv the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against th(' city, 

increas~d housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, c1nd displciced homeowners ~nd tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank vou for your consideration in this matter. 

u~ ~ Signed Name ~----"'---;~~---- / / -- i /, __ "'_)_ ,~ ·- Date 

Printed Name 

Street 

City / State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

1., the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation., Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to impiernent the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships ori the elderly and poor, and di~placed homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

c&k ~- Signed Name J/-Jt-/'5 Date 

e>/'~ J{~·'-'4''--',.._t) __ ~.J-.,.;k.-_=1,-C...-4;e:i---....,,,. ___ _,,--- Printed Name 

z_;)?{; /city/ State Zip , 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code. that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

· increased housing tosts, hardships on the elderly an~ poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

i urge you i:o research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ~-~---Date 

Printed Name 

-~::;_o_~ __ __,\~C-\.;_h_t.u..A._, __ . -'~---e__;;C.=-. __:r_S""-)_,"----- Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

p,=rmission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on t_he elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-~_{-1_/Vl_td_./--e_.v~J _____ Signed Name ~.15_- Date 

·------ Printed Name 

__,3~/ 0"'--'£~·"'"--1' be=-· _rt__,l/,___,~"----r-~ e{---,,./_/l_p~-t-· __ Street 
I 

City/ State Zip 



,,.,.,.. 

To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended conseqw~nces to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on.the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants c:(e 

just sorne of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Than~ '/OU for your consideration in this matter. 

!;;J_~_:/ _, ____ Signed Name .Jl!../6.j.B,;__.--' Date 

,£/f_fd,_l!J_· ---------- Printed Name 

5o 1{ /V, !Nt'dtrt: Street 

~ ,p r..,, cl,[/) If O )C[ rf.-city I State Zip 

/ 1 ~~ct( 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor; and disl?laced homeowners and tenants are 

just sorne of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have. experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name _____ Date 

Printed Name 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

. no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights ~ITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly an'! poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~~£) Signed Name .1,-1~ - \ S Date 

1ffrl~ Printed Name 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on t~e elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

1A0{\_1 1d± 'QC, -w,o1' Printed Name 
\ 

_____..,______,L\\,.__.__..,\,~\(C~X'\_So:::-=:,--~-- Street 

___ City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, h~rdships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

T;---'--+-'-, n---'-lc,.,<o:..,,_..q..,fu~/GL~()--- Signed Name 

__,_}_\h __ U---'Eo=,--~--f:_1 _______ Printed Name 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration, The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

impiemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased ho_using costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and t~nants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

--1-)S->-+)_,_(j\=-+-/_S ...... t-.;_b,...._\-=-~-------- Printed Name 
I 

Jo __ O_~_~_~W~o/('--, _..d _______ Street 

----~e5 tor_, __ !+_(_\_,_, ______ City/ State Zip 

I() /f b (A( __ Date 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing co~ts, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants ar~ 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_)'1;1,,___....,.~.c=__-.. Cffl--'-'-"""'"'a"""'~-'---'--"',a__--'----- Signed Name _iL-- I &J - / b Date 

Printed Name 

City/ State Zip 

{(····· 



I 
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To the Mayor and City Counci!, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that inciudes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Tero much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targ€ted for a violation.. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of c;Jde enforcement become necessary 

to impiement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hards~ips on the elderly and poor, and disp!aced homeowners and tenants are 

just sorne of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Tr.onk you fo1· your consideratio~ in this matter. 

~ / ' _,,./, ( r/·· 
• /,,J' ' ,· 

-----· Signed Name 1.) - ) -7 -· I < Date ---'-~-'---_....., ~1._--LJ___ 
/ 

.p,.--, I / ' /. l t? / l 11 I / 1' ; rt· t' j --- /' j,;l_· ,_lC,_l _ ..... 1:--_f _ _J. .. , /, ________ Printed Name 

"l 

21101 .!~/-/ ,·~---·.~,; -_- L_-·_"_4'_ ~-'·"""~'-/_~_, __ -____________ Street 
I 

·-·1 Is z· i..Aty tate 1p 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

inc!eased housing costs, hardships on· the elderly and poor, and displaced homeow"!.ers and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ~J-J _-_I~] ___ Date 

Street 

~Jt.e.SbOrO,; Y?J }-- City I State Zip 

/ ~4-o} 

) 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

, used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessar1 

to implement the code and drive up rents ori the poor and fixed income. La_wsuits against the city, 

increased housing C?sts, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants a!e 
just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

_u_-_/6 __ ·-·~Ls_· - Date 

__ I.__..O~L-Z...__._U_=&e'-"'11.....,IC;,/,:;........;,,.s ~.,,_7',....__ _____ Street 

,..-) 
(__) 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is:not the one. It needs more revision. 

Toe much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights .WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to imo!ement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences.: 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienci:!d and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name I /-/G_-t( Date 

,1)/1 /"< J /) h 
_I_ r_ f.)Jl:a;;..__':4!1 _ _,,1--------- Printed Name 

_/6 {) f lifft_1 cA_-=··_,,,,_,_Sef-___ Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. !t needs mor1:. revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights ,WITHOUT -:1 signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elde!IY and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced 2nd gua;d 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name 

_l\,l;..__.c.-==(j::;_;~---'-(\--..:.l.C"--:;L....,_\ .,,,.,c!J'---- Printed Name 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced ~omeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consider~tion in this matter. 

Signed Name __,_J/t_J~_/12__· _Date 

Printed Name 

-°'~o-=-8---+JJ=--......_(;"--"-°"(_l,v_~:j----- Street 

jn--esboro I l,4fZ 122./o J City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increas~d housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners ~nd tenants are 

just same of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of.a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name )jvtr~N) 

~t~ese....+-><-·+(-nt-~£_\......_,f,m~J()- Printed Name 

C\-.L..·:J.J-.-0~__,J---'-J'. ____ Q it~C~m ............. 1Jat_1+--- Street 

~b.in) m ;r2Lt1 I City I State Zip 

\ \ - ( lo - \ ':) Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, ~nd displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

\ b. .rvf(IJ 
_ .j ef~vV\:}-·-~-+'("""!==------- Signed Name ~-l5 ___ Date 

~R_W\3 ~ ~-{C,_,_f ___ Printed Name 

_2Q__,__7_____.___~-{'_U.._( L ____ Street 

1Y)Qsh,ft) , AR .. . City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too muc:1 is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and·some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

w:ed in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

tc implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, ha~dships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name I ;,-;l /is- Date 

bk M a_ f~ Printed Name 

-79-fLo/ 
City/ State Zip ----------------------



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor anc;l fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the.elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

! urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_____ Signed Name I/-/G--1.5 Date 

_(}72_ ............ a=Lc....l .... ~ =~--e'-/---~----· o......,..(Yl_.....e~//_0_------- Printed Name 

Street 

~ 0 12esba_t_-'C-O _(l'-+;r_,__--L.7_Z_c"'--f_C!J_I __ City I State Zip 

0 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and f?OOr, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Date 

___;;;;:S_'\_c>_~-""'-\\-'--. --=--~....:...._---+-"\c.,-~-· ------ Printed Name 

Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.J Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents ~n the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor; and dispJaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ oJila~t~t'-'---'-· ____ Signed Name Date 

+,<W_,._O\,,_,_;"*'-Afl-""'~ .._~ ...... c1,I-__ 0_._1-'--"o. ..... )f: ....... Y""""I;)_, ----- Printed Name 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

irnr,lP.mented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housin& costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenant~ are 

just some of the :consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against uninten,\,i·::! consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank vou for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name // .-- I& - ;l._ol,,,,. _ Date 

Printed Name 

Street 

I 

_3C911~()•/'l)f A t~(~--~--·'~A~z.~,c_,_. --- City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code: is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citize.n of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOL~T a signed 

permission sllp. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the eld_erly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

!//7 ;r Date 

Printed Name 

( 

joJ A( '6nJ 1-e. /I Street 

City I State Zip 

0 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. lawsuits against the city, 

increased ~ousing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and !enants are 

just some :of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ 

J)t(A:;) ev ~A --------~--~,,_,_ ________ Signed Name / /-/ t·-JS·Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hard~hips on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_1~_.·,. · .. -~--SignedName 

All,· ~ -e 
---~, ,, 

Printed Name 

;/I /17 /IS 
I 7 

Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade ho-meowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housi!lg costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tena!:)tS are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name __ J / - / 7- / S Date 

.~;.... ______________ Printed Name 

----=~"-"'5'--5-vi.J""-""'-','---Af-'-'\.__\ ...... \S.,__..._~--- Street 

~"'s 'o0<0 1 A '(L ___:J___).r.!..,.___,\o=-\-1----- City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

!, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other dties to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the.city on behalf of codr-: l;"~nforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

i~creased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeo~ners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

" '! urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

__ Xr.L!!!_&f1_(2.~'ll~(b~,'~Z:. ______ Signed Name _f /-_[7-/ S __ Date 

---K°'~"~e_._V\~--~--'--e:~'{_'(\.-'--0.."---v\.-"-M_=Z.'-_ Printed Name 

323 Street 

A \<... . l l-<-t 0 \ City I State Zip 
I 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision . 

. Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.> Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. inspection fees assessed. by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive. up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and d~splaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ( / - / 1- /5 Date 

{cefce (e~.------- Printed Name 

Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly an_d poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_._.,~,c....__..:;... ___ h __ __,~'--------- Signed Name //. / ] - ( , Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is ieft to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.J Other municipalities have 

implerriented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT. a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on _the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

- r 1-1~ 
------"""'..)""' Date 

Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housin~ costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenan~s are 

just some of the:consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Jl !?·5 Date 

Printed Name 

~d3~1_J_.--'--)_[ks_Af--L-. _:tf._4_ Street 

Jt--=--=-\J'l'J._S_b_(f)()---'-J_JY __ 7_J..!_~_<f_{_ City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

l, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation., Other municipalities have 

implemented cedes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessar1 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

inc~eased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced horneown~rs and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~---~ Signed Name &tJ , /l-b /J - Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up r!;!nts on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, ~nd displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

___ Signed Name 1 
/ / I ·7 / I _(.- Date 

J r j 

Printed Name 

Street 

tJ f ~7 ).. ( / &j __ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.0 Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced _homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Tha k you for your consideration in this matter. 

_d.L--h-~_J_ 1·~li~~-· ~-~·-~-~~~~~-J~_j1\_) __ Signed Name 

Printed Name 

q O (Q ~ ~\o'l\\, ~~ t \ \~ Street 

I\\' City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion ofone person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elder!y and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

1))~)11~ 1J()J~ .wdName I ( -11-/Qo.,e 

~5 '1~ a I~ tWl1 LO 2 · sm i th Printed Name 

Street 

' ~~Jflb\ ' r-\ i ! ·.• .· . ;() <t, V . :v I ~ ity I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct; but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced hom~owners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

( (~-- ' 

~-,~~ {/. J('J) / 
Signed Name .lL_!_ I --~,r.0i{bate 

( ( ' . (J f)h,J/1 f 
r ' 

Printed Name 

Ii, l K_ __ City I State Zip 

CJ 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesb6ro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But imp/ementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citfa.en of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 
\ 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardship~ on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. : 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

} n I LY~ate 
1 I 

Printed Name 

D_u.=.-\_o _____ \~_"_·, _' _,,_1~__.._-~ _(\. ___ Street 
___ , 

'\ < xs~"" ~ -P \.\\) \ ~ D {\Q ~~v ( · \...J ~ ,. City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and disi?laced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displac~d homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~_::.L__:_c.....!.t;~·L~--------- Signed Name ii-I?-J j Date 

Printed Name 

Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

. no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increa~ed housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners ~nd tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~1111t 1i1 '! I 
I 

L!-17/ir 
' 

________ Signed Name Date 

Printed Name 

_..M~~=-o ..... reA~----------- Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and d~splaced homeowners and tenants are 

just s6me of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name 

_)_/_5 __ ..)-"-~-~-~-t..._e._s-_·f ____ Street 

J [} fl(?_ 5 b __ o_,_o_A_~_K_'-l_1_J._cf J_I_ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly af!.d poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

;Ju __ ip.,._r_"') __ ~--------- Signed Name If - r l - ) s Date 

Z tAcMry ~y; er 
____ · _______ ! __ (\ ___ Printed Name 

~~! 5 s·-p 1~ce r 1. __________ f_V' __________ Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on t~e elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Signed Name \\-\1-\5 Date 

Printed Name 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Ever1one wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

, used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced ho~eowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name // //1 '- b Date 

__ S_
1

_\~c:>...-=-\r-~6~Y\~-D+''"'--~--""-Y'_{a"'-'6"-' ¥' _____ Printed Name 

Street 

_R ....... R....,.· __ 7_2_1j~o_{_ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

!, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Othe; municipa!ities have 

implemented cedes similar to this and some results have been a disa~ter. The Admin;strat.ive Search is 

used in other .::ities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights .W11HOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased ~ousing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and _tenants are 

just sorne:of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thanl.z you for your consideration in this matter. 

J~.""'-'l _____ Signed Name 

~ I rg--Grc: __ ev= _______ Printed Name 

_Jh.JJ.::_l5 __ Date 

_go 4 CarllA, t~f-c t- Street 

_ _J_Q_lle0_J2n[o ft~ J« 40 I City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs! hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name /J_ / 7- .2.£2!_5 Date 

5i=--~-'--t_r_L_-e..:.../ __ 4_· __::;..~-~-~ --'-;:--,_72_~ __ /_· J_U ___ Printed Name 

J_jo1Cc~ Street 

9~-+-,':><...C~._,_· _/)_.2-_l./_O_/ ___ ,. City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on.the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name //-/7- J,r Date 

_,_ff/_..,___! ' ___ e: ___ h_-e,....._/!_f~ __ O~l--'.1+-h.,....,b~tz~-~s~- Printed Name 

_d....,_______,_/_'7 ______ !/-l'--'---1 ' ___ e....._/(.........,_~O__.f<)._.,.V_' _-S_T __ Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly a'!d poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name _\ \--+-+l \ '\_\--=-\5 _ Date 

__ --_--"ili"'-"<-..,._.__..Y\_.......Q).,__.,.._\c_--"~-=-e_=------- Printed Name 

_::s;-=. =:...),,LLn.U...:,e.._l~t'l)l:i-<e,,L.. {.:__::0,:___~/+'--'-{-=---Z-_ __.·]'--'-Q"'-~.o-=.+-l- City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in.control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and djsplaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ "'111 ffio# Signed Name J / - J ·) ~ I ~- Date 

,(Q_.,___,,,.eJ....,ffi,,,_-,k,~---\fy\---.,;
1 

;\'--'<-~-"-s-=· _G_'--';.._P.._· --- Printed Name 

~ (1)(\ e Sb ol O I A~ 1 d ~ C) ) City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have· been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced hor_:neowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

,:::-,.. (:) ~~~---. (j (S 

'111/«yi~ ~f et'-, 

Signed Name 

Printed Name 

-'~l t,/--\-a o+----'=-"'C G ........... ,d_.,.,._,w [_, ~.,,,.,.......h_+_~ +-__ Street 

_Llont:Sh6·rO 4/Z ]~'Wo( City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

ver{ people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of .Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights ,WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased _housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners an~ tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to resE-arch the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Ck ~&_l{,D_--____ Signed Name _ / /- / ?-/ 5 Date 

lio~ ~ t1_ __ L_.l ....... t_e_5_' ·------ Printed Name 

_llo3 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonabie fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codE:s similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the .city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing cost_s, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are. 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter . 

..r,..:,~,----IZ==-=-· - j ~--·-·-··,_. · ___ Signed Name J.LL; i: /1 _.e;-_ Date ~ I 

Printed Name 

Aflc f . City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships o~ the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~=--'----b"~.'--.r-"-''f hc........:~--'-~--J__,_/_rt, n-'--'/_· f' ____ Signed Name JL.:..12.- /5 Date 

Printed Name 

~-/-"'-I.J_A-'--(_A_4..a.-./_,..f_· "'-L,--J_····_r--./i ....... /i_,_·. ,,__/ ____ Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly a_nd poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Date 

Printed Name 

'2, I 3 i;::;}/// r S /, ,..,,. I 
~

7
e;__"------+C/__,,._ ____ -''-------- Street 

J t>11 ,r ,5 &' D>" O ~4 ;<! P@ / City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and _displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

1/-17- ;s_ Date 

Jc=-: -=+h"'"'a ........ ttt-=-·'--A_fl?___,1_
1 l_c_h_e_--. _;_I __ Printed Name 

l/JO~Carlvri#h+ s+:t! I Street 

_JL..f-0~11--1-'e .............. s<......ebc....=O_;_~-=t>___.P'----t_, _7-='2-0_6_,_) __ - City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in·control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced h<?meowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-J.,+=--"---"--. -ll--f......,,.~"----+

1

.,.... _-_·· _____ Signed Name ///JJ/r5- Date 
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__,__(_.OfJ ..... 'k..__./,_.4!1-..£-=-w~!'.l~~-;---a~~-------- Street 

jo,.-Jo • .,.a /k,k_ ?l-f/o ! City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation., Other municipa'lities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increase_d housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners a!:]d tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~ 
r h,\ l,Q ktiJ°' 11 

Signed Name 1lf-1-1-+ / -b Date 

Printed Name 

_·':,_0_Q __ lJJ~(_':J'~l_C~e'~'1+-i+~e'_~_·t __ Street 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade horneowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing cos~s, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants arE;_ 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~:/0fa----·-··_·· ___ Signed Name 

I J ei 111 -e5 Y" u n g; 

1./- / 'J- /5- Date 

Printed Name 

300 f~C~/J/e/ Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive _up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, ·hardships C?n the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

44~-----' --· Signed Name / / - I I - I 5 Date 

(!__ ~ ,_,/ 0 /, /; /41 :, Printed Name 

_J'--""'-D~l)-t-cb.,,._.A_}_, _( _"-t'_&t_--/v_.-_·_f1_. pf_!_· Street 

,,,..---
_) 1 _ . .L1 ·"""' t v~oJ 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~,~ ....... e ___ \cl-+=-cod:"""'""--=--~=~ -- Signed Name l\- l7- 15 Date 

~tri(E'... Printed Name 

lcx::x:J ccsill\'\S'h ± Street 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.' Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, a~d displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

___,,,_(~~-----~-+, --i' ,__/L_-Jv _______ Signed Name 

__ r_~O_c;...._, __ lA_f\_~ __ /_t5+~-+ _______ Printed Name 

_i_o_~_\_<_(_,\_L_h ___________ Street 

_:5_!:::o..:_v'--"(5~·~=0_r_o __ r_\_V._-'7_;.)_'i_·· _0_\ _____ City/ State Zip 
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_________ Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no iecourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced ~omeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

jf,l7'-15 Date 

_R_~-'"'c::....;:..~-',e..---l"'f&-P_c:..,_; n_~_e_...;1 _____ Printed Name 

---=5-->,,,<_0 \~i>_;:,,.,;~.....__.+.___51_, ___ Street 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and djsplaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank '{OU for your consideration in this matter. 

(_l~~ 

L~ (l{) €!.Le_ <!o lefn« ~Printed Name 

/ / -/ 2-/~ate -Signed Name 

~~LJ_.£_5=----1--L-A/~·l _/11.i....=.ct:1_::c..=.i-d...L....>._l,)......._{)~b- Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeovvner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income, Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced home~wners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

d , •1'\ c·.,,. /1 {,u"" --/ffi';#"-,.,. __ ._c::_./_~h-_..___~t_,,U~-~7~----- Signed Name 

{/ ( 

WaV5hett 
I 

Printed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and ~isplaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-+J}--'-1)'--"~-=-="--".,.,__~-, _/J ........ ~ ........ : __ · ____ Signed Name Date 

~--d_/l__.,~~'-d--~l/_cJ~) __ City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro 1:; outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed incom~. Lawsuits against the city, 

increas~d housirig costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners ~nd tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

_<Q_" __ (),..:_~_;_, ~ __ h_f\_J_e__{ 5 _____ Printed Name 

d"U~ S?"'~e_ 5+ --------'--"*,---------- Street 

7l¥01 City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enfprcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced h~meowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name / / -J 7 -/ j Date 

__ J_e-~53~....;;;;C_....,.{L"'-c _£_ff)-'--b _____ Printed Name 

./Io r;, Al 
i 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. · Lawsuits against the city~ 

increased housing co~ts, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants ar~ 

just some of the con:sequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

i1,~-P11~ Signed Name // - / 7- I .S~te 

_J3 V r 6 n D ttq a Y1 Printed Name """"-----t~------:-~-+--------~ 

9)/ 

_J_o_n_e._s_b_~_,_o--1-~A_1i_,_'1_J_lf_tJ_/ - City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may· be targeted for a violation. Other municipa!lties have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced hom_eowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you tc research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter . 

. ~ /~-'=-·=~--~--- Signed Name 

__ b---=a,.=-),_+_o_~-'-' _B"""---· -'--/1'_0...,_/~J~e.~r~---- Printed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, ha!dships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

} /-17-1§:.,. 

_Jq//+---+--'(i-w; ___ &______.;....~--'---'--c(_. ~-··_ Printed Name 

Ytf1 &t/ #vC fl/ h-71&0 ! .. , 
I 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased ho~sing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and te~ants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

11r5:SzJ0{gc­
-=-~--· ~'~~~~h ,5_, {e_c_-_ Printed Name 

Signed Name / f I tz/12oate 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased h~using costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and t~nants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter . 

. ~ a:~ Signed Name 
l I # I~- /5 Date 

Le.,{'(/ f v- \ ~( Printed Name 

Lfo l- ( Ct+ -e_ Street 

11 Lf 6 / City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that inciudes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up Tents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, ~ardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrustupon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you fbr your consideration in this matter. 

C .Sc/J ~ ;i Signed Nam, 
.,......~~~~~-,-~~~~~~~~~~~~ 

_lf?-5~ 
Printed Name 

/()di w Udj1}11Jc11v'v;;;:: 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

perrnission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on.the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenanee code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~){iffi SfuruS _ Signed Name 1J:Jl-j_6:_· _ Date 

~~j-+-fr:) ........ r;~~___,"..._f ___ Printed Name 

Jill 1l2 Hunn ,hgffi Aoe Street 

~robxc) Moosw ]M_ City/ State Zip 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly a~d poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

----,----~--~--- Signed Name ~Date 

~bo Printed Name 
~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~-

? 2 'iO f City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and_ displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

//- /1- !Soate 
) 

~~---i-=cJ=----])_7_3_:fa---+=. '-1-+-r-,.......;,;:nes=----- Printed Name 

.:........i.) J-'-'-}f~ff..lLJ..tJn..,___,+t'-'-ay~t.<-4-()4-'Y) _____ Street 

_::r:_(!; Y/--=-e'.5~1_oY'i_o__,_, +-,R....:.:.,.....;..,g,c__7_:_, tfi_'o,_'./ __ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

E'Jeryone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fol!rth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced hon:ieowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ b\0/.CV\~ ~- Signed Name 

-----'-0~~\='---~, {)-+--S\~o____,~,~E---S __ Printed Name 

\\ \ \ >t__ \A\ }J)Q\~D\\ Are, Street 

~D\"'D~Thm I Ai ~ :1 ldD ( City I State Zip 

f(,-/7-IS Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increase~ housing costs, hardships on the.elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners a~d tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

--~-{'.-::::::-.f -=::-_ _..1_ Signed Name ll{cl2._ Date 

__ irJ_,.,.\ /'-'-l,_.1~t_fn~~~~~--·~--- Printed Name 

/0(1 w +hu J ~ 1 sl: C)!l Alt Street 

.~~b<'-~"'--~· l'Zst{'> Lty I State Zip 

R 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of c0de enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, ~ardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_lfY]_q...LL--"""""~""""'--
1 

..Llo..,,.1.._Lp_,__,,_-""Gp'-11-=c _,_nu...;;c..:_.;o=---- Signed Name _LJ.lL1.Jl_s.___ Date 

N\eJ ~ "S_j;;~f\,____P_) _ .... 0 ..... o ...... ne_· ·=-6=· '------ Printed Name 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
' . 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too rnuch is left to discretion of one person and the people in control ofthose persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly an~ poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

J/-11·- 11:J 
? 

Date 

__ /fl--+-,.·....,.,/~,--. 'N-=----'"'e~{g~~"-'--?-~~-61<---_. ___ Printed Name 

_ __,,_;g--=-)_._~_Jf t!J--=--<--~11~_/)£_· · __ Street 

1 /J11 -'J/J '. 1 D 1,) uL{tJ!)l:g ~-v--~'--'--,__. --+-[_!__/""!_ ·_7_ City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a Code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased h_ousing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and !enants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

--- Signed Name _(_1 Lt1l. .1s- Date 

_____ £_-_f l_~_--+-\.\c{+-'-· ~J_\ }.} ____ Printed Name 

----'--'\ b_u_(l ___ ~_v_f~vJ-~--- Street 

~ \Z /)') 4 c 'city/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, ~ardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other .cities have experienced and .guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~-+-',A.....::,.,:t\£........,.rt~d::)......,....._ __ Signed Name 

~£Qo~-£\=-r -.L..A.J-~-=....::ae></;_{Y\_,;S:;c.._ __ Printed Name 

Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on t_he elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

e~,m4 
~L.{Y\o,~~ 

Signed Name _l_j_:- L} - / ,?Date 

Printed Name 

~Lf C(}jj~~ ~LJ--=lb:...::-..<}--=Lc__,_fr'\ -~--)-·~) _ Street 

3Gv-OA1:nb :iJl- I J Ya I City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on th.e poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships ·on the elderly a_nd poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

#,Cd .lq;:u/ Signed Name l \ '- \ '1 - / ~s Date 

_6_y--+-=c==-\~~-=u~L--=-v"'-·-!t"'~=-__ ~c=------ Printed Name 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

i, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very p1"ople many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

ur,~ea:;onable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to corrett, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and th~ people in control of those persons actions. Th1:re is 

no recourse to a dty official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

icn.pier11ented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights .WITHOUT. a signed 

p>?.rmission ::;!ip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on beh;:iif of code enforcement becorne necessary 

to ,rn;:,lement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

incn~ased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced h_:'.)meo,vners and tenants are 

just .~ome of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guF.ird 

against unintended consequ,~nces thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name _Lj_-jJ_- / S__ Date 
L,/ 

Printed Name 

-·--3-1'2--~ ~ n :f+-A-"--,8'-- Street 

~~Jaile4bfC /lf;$ ___ City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this.is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permi5sion slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, a_nd displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~ '% --~--~;:___;:.r____;;::_' __ Signed Name 
L l I I >-] 115 

Date 

Printed Name 

Street 

--------(j 6 V\~.b__<::) ft) A(\l.. 12.t--\O "\ity / State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and 1;:>oor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

lh IIJ.{~:,__( _/)'---ri,e-/_f(U_(_b_h_ ___ Printed Name 

'7 oo ol, JL -sl!-e4'+ 
__ 0 ___________________ Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants ,i better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includ€s the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need ·a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on th1: elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_tftJ'li Signed Name 
I I e-- t 7, I~ 

-------- Date 

-,&J_b_e2r-t Sm td> Printed Name 

Jo(ufs/!/:)~O _;j/~ z:llf{J/ City/State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

, increased housing costs, ha!dships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ( ( ·- / ·7' ,; Date 

_,,,,0,=Q_{~_._f_/ J_,___bf=--. ~_Y_)<::: ____ Printed Name 

___,.3?"'--/-h'---';2"--(f)_(._{_ _( U_I~_. _ street 

0,.. / _ ~ n. ·1,.nJfo f ~ ___ W_0_v_o_· _r_o___.'--J-_YJ-<_, __ 0 ____ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased hou~ing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and ten~nts are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~Wk Signed Name 

_}__,__\.,_,,.~.;:..,w......L.-..___,,;;_\:)-.!..:\(l\_(A......__L ____ Printed Name 

___;\..,,,,,_J_,,,,__6'{\Q-'--'-"-,)...__b15\---'U~,_,_ff'l~-1~~~q--=Q-1-J __ City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arka,nsas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. ·Lawsuits against the city, 

i~creased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeo~ners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~-------~--~~~--· ____ Signed Name Date 

--'~=<.L.>oA'-"-' f_...,,l),_._~ _y+--'-~----'\._.I..___._._u_h----'-Y\--'h---"-~-(\__ Printed Na me 

\ 

---'~""""-,)_o_l_S_,_m_C-"-'-( /_.;.G_· \_'--A---'-'-Q-=-) -- Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displa~ed homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

---"dj~~~L~~-----L-··. ··-···_·· SignedName -------- Date 

---4,[~f6"°--·,;ra---=· ~U--()J---=-rk-='-e_. --Printed Name 

----={3=--/~/__,,C}=--,,___,(N'----C{j__.__~--"""-r--=<.__- Street 

/Ir_ )x.CftJ (city/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

. permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poo_r, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

____ C._. /t~~---j_· ·_~)~~~-JG_,, __ Printed Name 

___ 3_/°!_· -~O_JV'\_c_c~\ ~_J_~_ Street 

__ _,=:}.,..... -r-=0-~._k..,..\.,..b}~~__,,f-'-· _· _A .... r __ 1._'.1_~_o-'-) City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.' Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees asse,ssed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hards~ips on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name /!- /G - IT Date 

Printed Name 

__._,_3__,__/ 'f+---........ /7J-'--_t1_C_._.A_tt..._Y,_c?-______ Street 

----=J=c...-<-=-b_l?_t'-_:5_:;_b)_r_o _ _,/k~•-·-__,4).._..-,....'£_0_/ __ City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code an.d drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

incre~sed housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowne~s and tenants are 

just:some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideratior. in this matter. 

__ ,-.c::@::..:::.._/Ji---=1/)f~'J?-""'-,Gl.......,<fz{~··'-""rl~~-- Signed Name 

------'RI--L-.Qb-=---<=~=f .... r ..... · a==.,__b.._· · ..... UI ...... 0__._,,..8"1------- Printed Name 

...... d..>.x;Q,,__q-,,....:.,_E_._l\~J.Q;.,,...lz....:..+e,....,,.,.._.H..-:0 ...... 0 ....... A.......,v ....... e ....... ---- Street 

City/ State Zip 

l/-/9-15 Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing_costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants_ are 

just some of the consequences. 

i urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~~--::,F---r-.&-~~~-=----_ Signed Name //- 17--J5 Date 

_5-=--~---'-e---'-('_C::J'""""l~~---=-=~~1--'0__._.Cb ........... G......,c\,,.x.---- Printed Name 

_5_~--'--'Lo=---w_.::;..\__;, w:;...__;;;..._a(!)O=-=' d~,D=-0-=c.-_ Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, h_ardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-·~...c......-..,..~"'---·---M-fi---,.,"_, _______ Signed Name Date ---------
l{- ifu -tS· 

£g_=-=--'-'~-'-----~~-··--_.;:;_· _· -------- Printed Name 

Street 

--~(L..J:.c....:...::c.i.::~=:::c._----------- City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

iric;-eased housing costs, hardships on the elderly an<;t poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

! urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other citie5 have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

E /'1 'c / L ___ A_lo~~s~~-)-----· Signed Name l,--J, f I~ Date 

Printed Name 

Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

imp!emented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

.. , used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission siip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and di~placed homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

\-\f.-\S-
Signed Name _\ ___ ~_ Date 

__ W_V_,_L_ v_-_C,_· _u_9 __ w_i_' I_I _, · _A_Wl_· _:s-:_o_· vi._ Printed Name 

__ W __ D_· _tl_&_')_1-v_~_· ·_t-___ Street 

J O\A fSbovD 71'--1 O l __ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing. a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of'Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

. implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to irnplement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced ho!11eowners a~€! tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to resecirch the effr:cts of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your r:onsideration in this matter. 

J. d.. C-£/11' T Printed Name 

2.. 2 O?- t&{l(O fl(/// £OD Pit V;f, Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing, a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of'Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOlJT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and p~or, and displaced ho_meowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other citjes have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~'-"'=--==-·~a_J0f~..,...,.fir. .......... ~~' ~---Signed Name _jj_-_:t_l:__1£__ Date 

~~ Printed Name 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned .. oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing· a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of·Jonesboro is outl,rndish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implE:mented code~. similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WIT!:!Q.!JL a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced ho!11eowni?rs and tenJnts are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to re.se,irch the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

--~----Signed Name fl~ l<..J .... 20tffte 

___ 5AMH~~+....._ _______ Printed Name 

_ __..;;_)_3 __ 0_2---'-4'_..;._~___./r(Z'-'-'W'--'A"--~ ftd-___.D ___ , ___ Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned .. oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing· a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of'Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implE:mented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displac~Q ho!lleowners and tenants are 

just some of the co~isequences. 

I urge you to rese,irch the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name __ / / h ( )s-_ Date 

Printed Name -----

-=-2.~1L-'{)::........:..../_=G'-"t.~e=Alc.=-=W--={)'---'{)'--IJ ______ Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disast!=!r. The Administrative Seuch is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become r,ecessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits again;;t tlte city, 

increased housing costs, ~ardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners an!:! tenants arr~ 
just some of the conseqaences. 

I Llrge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experk:nced ,'.inrJ guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-~- o~,G..L<=+=--#',==-------- Signed Name --··----------- Date 

-- -_-=2__~ L _D_ _ _LX_u / _2_ _____ Printed Name 

Street 

5.d__a }: 5 I) 17 I/ c/ - t) IL j_J.JJ.i!/_ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing, a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of·Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

imple:mented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permissior. slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced-ho!lleowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to resecHch the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name _11 / 2J l ~-----__ Date 

Printed Name 

_7-_\ ~--'-·--'J_v\_1 \_\lf __ c--=&-c.;.._ ______ Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.' Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WIJHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased h~using costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and t~nants are 

just some af the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name _i__l-:_! & __ · f) Date 

l A v'"l 1 VY) ~ tr C ,-'-\tl_,___ ___ Printed Name 

Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is ".",~tlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those person~ actions. There ls 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced home~wners and tenants are 

: just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_qi!;m---"--
_·,~'·,4..(~. -'""-~~-~= ....... rf'--__._· _y--4-_____ Printed Name ~~~~ 
~uV'71J() Street 

-·-- City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing cosJs; hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants arE: 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

__ a_~--~-~-------- Signed Name //-J-o-/ S" 

/] C, 15{-'t J. (: ~ S S- e-l .-C:--

-----~------------- Printed Name 

__ /_J'o_l_lv'_._l_'./. . ..,g...dt,-'-f_'k1_._J. _ _._.0'--'-f?. ___ Street 

-S-0°"'~5 <ho,-.., A- f<.. 1._J.-_e.!_c,_I ___ City/ State Zip 

Date 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is. not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster.. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights YJITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increase~ housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners an_d tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_:r_+i~-=f;---'e~$__.S._' e_t ____ i:~--- Printed Name 

--=--.&-/ /____,D l'---W:-=-=-" --"-"-H ~.......,_l 5 ~ftf evwJ~-- Street 

f/neakr>o, cm. 7.,L,+1)1 City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased houslr.g rnsts,.hardships on the e!c!cr!y and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

------J~~---=-· ~~~~;J ___ Signed Name J/-J{p- }5 Date 

-.:3,=.....,1. ..... /1'-' e""'--...... ~ ........... 1 ...... ·o .... ~..._--------- Printed Name 

-=--/'iL;..1 l ...... o-L..AJ..._e1'--'-"m....,.,5---....5r~, *_J5F _____ Street 

_.,..}o""'o_,_......<!'5-==, "-""b'--""'-D_,_,( 0=:-J/'-"-f}.._,_~-'-'-' _7"--~-~...,._2)_,_/ ____ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Ev2ryone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too rnuch is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a cit; official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes simi!ar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased hou_sing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and te~ants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

J¥ /1 ck. f}J.£lj,f?~, Signed Name //~ 20 ~ /S Date 

-___ JJ/Jlndr;L_Ur' I {LV Printed Name 

----'~"-"'1_CU-__ · fujt}--',=--->--'---p_l{_ttn~_v_v' ___ Street 

d OngsJw!"Q~ 1 71 L/ 0 I -City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the . ' 

vr:ry people many are trying to help. 

Everyone war.ts a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discret,on of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented codes s;milar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights ~JJHOUT a signed 

pet mission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderiy and poor, and displaced hon~eowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and gu.)rd 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-----··---- Signed Name 
,Ji I cJ- 0 1 JS" Date 1] _____ , ___ _ 

M) { e W..;._Wi__,_c;.:;_l _______ Printed Name 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to cJ city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and d_isplaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

/ J-f 9 J;;_' Date 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly an9 poor; and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

imp,emented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on ~he elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs,. hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Counci! for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the poss!bility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

impl2mented cedes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased h9using costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and ~enants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced ar.d gui3rd 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_,_f~-1?--=-Y?A--=-o<....c· c...-.,/~_-1,...,.u_~~·~-~-r; _______ Signed Name Jt_ZQ.:::_J.S: __ Date 

~ t.ei !we!/ Printed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to.the 

very people many are: trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. lt needs more revision. 

Too much is left i:o discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons ,:fctions. There is 

no recourse to ,~ ,:ity official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation: Other municipalities have 

implemented 'J>des similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed.by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income: Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced horn~owners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities ha\'1= experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

j;_Slt~----~Y}Y.\_~W§\.___ ____ Signed Name Date 

--· ~ ~~~--h_\\~ Y:) ~.-~_,W.__.S'\...,.___ ___ Printed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

· Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for any.one that may be targeted for a violation.· Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and t~nants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly·and poor, and ~isplaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

_l~}-_2_0 ___ ; /~5_oate 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly ~nd poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name l )~ 15 Date 

~ kx Cb'\\ds ~J:L ____ Printed Name 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs,. hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Date 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the poss1bility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.' Other municipalities have 

i;11plemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

inuc:ased _housing ccsts, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners an~ tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

kF- Signed Name _ffi.JJ2.ll~/ _Date 

/Z~:ff-1 ~_;_·_s_u t!J/1 ;12/v1 ( Printed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

!, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and wili cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission sHp. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf -of code enforcement become necessary 

to impiement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced h~meowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

l urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~~-- Signed Name _ff Zd- /5_.. Date 

Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, an~ displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ SignedName 

_.-) / r- I 
0"""''---+t~/-~_f__.:;__J =-j _ _..,_L:.._t/_//'l_//_-=,l/9-p---'-'-, _e_.( ___ Printed Name 
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7 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Eve·ryone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

Jncreased housing costs; hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced home~wners and tenants are 

: just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Date 

Printed Name 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

---'=-"-, lo-'---"'-\ {;--+-)d--"-'-+--"p~l ~-· ___ Street 

/( '\I fl ]<n/"'. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elde~ly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a mainten~nce code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

S-~iLA;Gl'.~flh,-.,..w-0.....::_:vJ..__:.._+.i~H.L-"J~=--' __ Signed Name { ( / Z df I S: Date 

~onlt1Dl ([L;_fj Printed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardshies on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences.: 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

(J mJf(_ (J/[(k0 
Signed Name 

{}j_n Md~ a/_o V f\-- Printed Name 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing ~osts, hardships on the elderly and poor, and.displaced homeowners and tenants _are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experh~nced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you f r your consideration in this matter. 

lf l.~--,+----1....j-t-J.!..._.J-....:::.._j,~--------- Street 

U1J11i/J(Jl(Z) 1/tL~---City I State Zip 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fine;; making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a cede that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.' Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increa~ed housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners.and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen bf Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.- Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disastt)r. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

. permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced_ homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in th's matter. 

ll11 WrlbatU3 
l2J1 Ado1'W 
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Printed Name 

Street 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation.' Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement thE: code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, a~d displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Street 

~~(~)\~~,Q\J,~. ~~: '-1-C ~Ti~h---r f_._i_G(~Q {~-City/ State Zip 

_l(H--'! r-=-d.,.._I l-c,1'5'---- Date 
I l 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion ofone person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elder!y and poor, and displaced homeowners and tencints are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

'io.Nll t/a,JS 
·-'---r-1--'-'- 7 

Jot ~ 1Ybw 
~1f,, 1t.OL4 I 

Printed Name 

Street 

City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

const1Jeration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

ve'r"y peop!e rnany are trying to help. 

Ever\1one wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addr-,:sse:; the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too m,,ch is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse, to ::i city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implement~d codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

t permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and po'?r, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of tht~ consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesburo. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

&i.~-& r 4.J~ l \; C{ rr\S Signed Name 

' 

1.-, -,0 .-./< ___ 0- ~ Date 

f~ Printed Name 

305/Qe~, 
·- r -· 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation/ Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees as.;essed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hard~hips on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-r(d:f;vi~I I(£(/ ' . Signed Name jj_-cJD- / !7 Date 

0 /~t~tedName 

j Q5_, D ~QJ fl&rief_street 

7 d L{l) f City/ State Zip 
I 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, ·hardships on the elderly an~ poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other, cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name ] j ~ d O - J. 0 IS Date 

Printed Name 

-'8._>,=,0\=:C'---'C""-'1c=,'-'-0-'--ro-'---'-.:....::Q::..,.. . .._n-o_._._c_· ----- Street 

-'-' ~--'-'("..L..l)(\~tS"-L. 6_,..,"""--'--f~D~h~~..,__:]~°'-ll...l...\0__,_\ __ City I State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation." Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on th~ elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

----4'~""""_..4,,.""_ .... q.,.., _.,,..j(l.,1,,1(/i'-'A'--".,.,..J.;;-c--=V':--------- Signed Name _ _il - ~ tJ~ - I 5 Date 

Printed Name 

-~""d.,._€,_}'.J.,____
4

'fv'.\--'-=!i\::..V1...,1..:..·r ___________ Street 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on _behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly ~nd poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

c+---PL ...... ~....,.----~~,....._.~,y[.~!#-__ t/ ______ Signed Name _Jt::::_Z O "if Date 

~/,'-"--'~"'L..L.6.L.r4~.,_/-6,(,,._. _,ffi~·..,_tt,....O'-"L/""'.:=-,.,_/2..__ ______ Printed Name 
l, 

IJ'2 L/0/ City/ State Zip 
I 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to thr 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalfof code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

. increased housing costs, hardships OI! the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

Signed Name . II- 2 tJ.,, ZrllL Date 

---=(_;;._1,,-'-//~=/J-1_o_M_'/! __________ Printed Name 

City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation., Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowner's and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased housing cost~, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and tenants are 

just some of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consequences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

-+-t=t,,_/ 1_.,__',tl['-'---,_M.'-'--=t-"/ t.~•'ff-'-'tf'-'5=· o_/J_, ______ Signed Name /(- l.8 - IC Date 

--'Kdi'-"· =-=-=-<..· -~"-'-'~~~~""""'"""'c.:.·<-<· c.L..--------- Printed Name 

_,,--.,_._, l--"'JC.C...4,,..,.e.._.,_5=b=c)-'-t_CF~/l __ /2-_~~~2~t/_0_ .. ~/ __ City/ State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people many are trying to help. 

Ever,one wants a better Jonesboro. But implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. We need a code that 

addresses the problems this one attempts to correct, but this is not the one. It needs more revision. 

Too much is left to discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is 

no recourse to a city official for anyone that may be targeted for a violation. Other municipalities have 

implemented codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative Search is 

used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants fourth amendment rights WITHOUT a signed 

permission slip. inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of code enforcement become necessary 

to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits against the city, 

increased ~ousing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced homeowners and.tenants are 

just some:of the consequences. 

I urge you to research the effects of a maintenance code other cities have experienced and guard 

against unintended consi::quences thrust upon the citizens of Jonesboro. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

j~ '-{n~ Signed Name . J /, JD, /5 Date 

City / State Zip 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against thern. 

Thank yo for your consicj,et'ati6 ,J,n this matter. 
,,,,,-) / ,fl' -

(.__/ / --, 
Signed Name /' 

Cb 11/t/ 1 fJt U .l}--e, t go IV 
Date 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at d@;_kson.@ltmesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hper~ln@lonesbO(Q.&Cg 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrlerson3@hotmail.com_ 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gya nce_.@jgnesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman £r£i£1b.@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplum~yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgeco~ruiouse.@b.qtmait.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@y:ahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street k#street.@2 ~gJobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschoo!s.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

a . 50 Rennell Woods rennell_woQds@vahoo.cqm 87~{}2 9/ /£6 I 
Tim McCall mtmccal!@.arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdbµrton10@yaho9.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
agaihst thern. 

/2- (4-15 
Date 

0002 Wao;i,,"St~, J Oo ~esbomJ ~f?. 
Street, City, Zip and State ~ 'lJJ{:) 4 
Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at d.iru;kson_@.lonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hnerrln@ionesbo(o.9rg 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gva nt.§..@i.Qnesbo ro.o.rg 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismoore12lumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hqtmai!!com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@y_ahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street iwstre~J@§ru;gJOb..fil:!)et 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.n~t 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rgnnellwoods@Y.ahoQ.co111 87~2 CJl<t 5[,!SCj 
Tim McCall mtmg:a.l!@Jlfkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburton1.Q.@Yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against thern. 

/~- I ~-fr;-
oate 

Printed Name 

Cove. 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 

at djfil;kso11@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hgerrln@jonesbOL9..&r.g 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com. 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gyance..@jgnesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman .£r.£i.gb@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffotthous~otmai!.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@jlahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street iwstreet@2 b~1obal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson iQhnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@.nettletonschoo!s.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 Q 

Rennell Woods rennellwogds@yahoo.con1 87~2 9195(:,61 
Tim McCall mtmccal!@.arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton u.:!!2.urton 1.Q@yahOQ.,ff.ml 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against thern. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

.lJlf:-'li.& G.k.MPti 1Slgne~ame 

Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at d.Jslckson@lonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin flgerrln@ionesbO(.Q.,Qr.£ 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com. 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gvance@jonesboro.or:g 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman ru;j9J2@sbcglobai.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplum~yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams e~qffeahous~)1otmaiLcorn 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@tahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street lit,/street@§bcglobj1l.rlet 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddovfil.@nettletonschoo!s.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 Q 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.fQ.nl 87~2 919Et.51 
Tim McCall mtmccal!@2rkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton tdburtonlP@~J1oo.com 870-933-0884 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 

unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 

a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 

WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 

become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

()aJr.il ~A.J ---/) . !</ - I J 
Signed Name Date 

(>c1 '[(,)\ e E cl0 ce c: .. 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 

at ~_mfKSon@jonesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hQerrln@jonesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cd'frierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@JibCg)oba!.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nett!etonschoo!s.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellw~QQ£.QJ11 87~2 9/'f 565? 
Tim McCall mtmccall@2 rkb!uecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 1@.~:&,hOO&Qfil 870-933--0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 

against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~ff\U@i~ 
Signed Name 

{2-/{j-1S 
Date 

··1D,h~CR 
rinted N~e 

Mc~7,-t_ 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@i<mesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hgen:ln~ionesboro.or.g 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gvance_@jgnesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crcjaJJ.@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplumhi.ng@yahoo.com 870-~72-1365 
Ann Williams e~offeehouse.@)1otmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@:lahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street lwstreet.@~bcgJobalJlet 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddov.fil..@nettletonschoo!s.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 Q 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@y_ahoo.com 87~2 919&6!S I 
Tim McCall mtmccal!@mkbluecrnss.mm 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton 1d.llurton1Q@_yahoo&Qro 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 
discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Printed Name 

} ) 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 

at d]?ckson@l<mesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hperr,1.!J.@jonesbor.9.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrlerson3©)hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gyance..@jgnesboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman gg9b@sbcglobai.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplumbi!]g@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams gdgecoffeehousEE.@b.Q!mfilLWm 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@Y.ahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street h¥street@;;!;.>s;_giobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschoois.n!(':t 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@.yahoo.com 87~2 919JSt51 
Tim McCall mtmccal!.@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton :!Jti2.urton10@.yahoo.corn. 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 

have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Th.ank·y. ou for your considerat.ion in~ 

~-~~ 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson.@i.onesborQ.Or:g so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hperrl!l@ionesboro.org 870-932-1052 

Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gva nc:g.@iqriesbo ro.o..rg 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismooreQlumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotnu1H!\;Qlli 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 

Chris Gibson clgrehabman@~ahoo.com 870-565-7669 

John Street jwstreet@#~lobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 

Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rgonellwoods@vahoo.co111 87~2 9195(,£>1 
Tim McCall mtmsgtl!@wkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tdburton1.Q@yahoo..&Q...in 870-933-0884 
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To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
agaihst thern. 

1a-11-1~ 
Date 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at _!;l_@f~son@jqnesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hperrln@ionesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gva nc~.@LQill!Sboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismoore12lumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@h.9l!!U1.il~com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson clgrehabman@yahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street iwstreet@2 bc__global.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nett!etonschoo!s.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods ren nellwoods@yahoo .con1 87~2 9195i,51 
Tim McCall mtm.rrfil!@wkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton :tdburton1Q@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 
very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that indudes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my belief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against thern. 

Tha k/ ou for your consideration in this matter. 
/ / 

// I 2--14- /S-
oate 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at d.h!fkson_@j_onesborg&rg so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin lmerrin@ionesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 

Gene Vance gva nc:g@j_q nesboro.or.:g 870-934~8900 870-935-9485 

Dr. Charles Coleman crcjab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 

Chris Moore chrismoore12lumbing@yahoo.com 870-972-1365 

Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse@hotrn.fil!,com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@~ahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street jwstreet@~lobal.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 

Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 

Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoQ.co111 87~2 9195t;,5? 
Tim McCall mtmscalJ.@.arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 

Todd Burton tclburton:J,O.@_yahoo.com 870-933-0884 



To the Mayor and City Council, Jonesboro Arkansas 

I, the undersigned, oppose the Property Maintenance Code submitted to the City Council for 

consideration. The code is invasive and will cause undue harm and unintended consequences to the 

very people who have helped make this city a great place to live 

Everyone wants a better Jonesboro, but implementing a code that includes the possibility of 
unreasonable fines making a criminal of a citizen of Jonesboro is outlandish. Too much is left to 

discretion of one person and the people in control of those persons actions. There is no recourse to 
a city official for anyone that may be cited for a violation of any of these codes. Other municipalities 
have implanted codes similar to this and some results have been a disaster. The Administrative 

Search is used in other cities to invade homeowners and tenants Fourth Amendment rights 
WITHOUT permission. Inspection fees assessed by the city on behalf of the Code Enforcement 
become necessary to implement the code and drive up rents on the poor and fixed income. Lawsuits 
against the city, increased housing costs, hardships on the elderly and poor, and displaced 
homeowners and tenants are just some of the consequences. 

It is my betief that these codes will be detrimental to our city and our citizens and I urge you to vote 
against them. 

Thank you for your consideration in this matter. 

~lu~ /Z-/4-(5 
Signed Name Date 

Col±OVl / verv1t,c 
Printed Name 

Street, City, Zip and State 

Please contact the Jonesboro City Council and let them know you are opposed to any of these codes 
being adopted. Be sure and copy each of your email's to the council to the City Clerk, Donna Jackson 
at djackson@ionesboro.org so it attaches to the permanent record to show opposition. 

Mayor Harold Perrin hgerrJn.@ionesboro.org 870-932-1052 
Charles Frierson cdfrierson3@hotmail.com 870-932-6643 870-932-8153 
Gene Vance gva nc_g.@lqrresboro.org 870-934-8900 870-935-9485 
Dr. Charles Coleman crciab@sbcglobal.net 870-931-3178 
Chris Moore chrismooreplumbing@.yahoo.com 870-972-1365 
Ann Williams edgecoffeehouse..@botmail.com 870-932-3114 870-931-9889 
Chris Gibson dgrehabman@~ahoo.com 870-565-7669 
John Street iwstreet~~Job11l.net 870-972-5788 870-935-0108 
Mitch Johnson johnsons3@suddenlink.net 870-273-6795 
Darrel Dover ddover@nettletonschools.net 870-351-7226 870-761-9393 
Rennell Woods rennellwoods@yahoo.co111 87~2 919Et.51 
Tim McCall mtmccall@arkbluecross.com 870-931-7546 
Todd Burton !Slbyrton1Q@yahoo.com 870-933-0884 
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