City of Jonesboro
300 S. Church Street

Jonesboro, AR 72401

Signature Copy

Resolution: R-EN-007-2020

File Number: RES-20:015 Enactment Number: R-EN-007-2020

A RESOLUTION AUTHORIZING THE CITY OF JONESBORQ, ARKANSAS TO ENTER
INTO AGREEMENT WITH THE WALMART FOUNDATION TO RECEIVE THE
COMMUNITY GRANT FUNDS TO UPGRADE THE ALLEN PARK COMMUNITY CENTER
SKATE PARK AND AMEND THE 2020 BUDGET

WHEREAS, the City of Jonesboro, Arkansas has been awarded the Walmart Foundation Community
grant from three different local facilities in the amount of $15,000 total, including $5,000 each from Stores

6876, 6943, and 128; and,

WHEREAS, the community grants are 100% funded with private funds and there is no cost to the City of

Jonesboro, Arkansas; and

WHEREAS, funds will be utilized to upgrade the existing skate park at Allen Park Community Center and
add additional obstacle courses; and,

WHEREAS, the City of Jonesboro, Arkansas passed the 2020 Budget in Resolution RES-19:201, which
will need to be amended in order to reflect the award amount.

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED BY THE CITY COUNCIL FOR THE CITY OF JONESBORO,
ARKANSAS THAT:

SECTION I: The City of Jonesboro, Arkansas will enter into agreement with the Walmart Foundation

from the three local locations.

SECTION 2: The Mayor and the City Clerk are hereby authorized by the City Council to execute all
documents necessary to effectuate this agreement.

SECTION 3: The 2020 Budget is hereby amended to provide a change in the in the Private Funds budget
for the Allen Park Community Center Skate Park.

PASSED AND APPROVED THIS 4TH DAY OF FEBRUARY. 2020.
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NO CONTRACT OR ORIGINALS PROVIDED BY GRANTS



From: cgadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Hillary Starnes
Subject: Walmart Facility# 128 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57190583
Date: Thursday, January 9, 2020 5:14:58 AM

Dear Grantsecker,

Congratulations! Facility # 128 has recommended your Community Grant application. Request 1D 57190583, to
receive a $5.000.00 grant.

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. I you do not receive your check in that time. please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 59175561
Address:
PO Box 1845
Jonesboro, AR 72403

You will also receive a final confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details, but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts to help people live better and wish you success.
Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/IMAIL/174920013



From: cgadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Hillary Starnes
Subject: Walmart Facility# 6876 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57190601
Date: Friday, December 6, 2019 7:25:19 PM

Dear Grantsecker.

Congratulations! Facility # 6876 has recommended your Community Grant application. Request ID 57190601, to
receive a $5.000.00 grant.

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. If you do not receive your check in that time, please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 58610665
Address:
PO Box 1845
Jonesboro. AR 72403

You will also receive a final confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details. but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts to help people live better and wish you success.

Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/IMAIL/172044539



From: caadmin@cybergrants.com

To: Hillary Starnes
Subject: Walmart Facility# 6943 Community Grant Request Status: Request ID 57726595
Date: Saturday, December 7, 2019 7:24:40 PM

Dear Grantseeker,

Congratulations! Facility # 6943 has recommended your Community Grant application, Request 1D 57726595, to
receive a $5.000.00 grant,

Please allow 4-6 weeks for delivery. If you do not receive your check in that time, please contact the facility
manager to make further inquiries. For your reference we have provided the check information and address below:

Invoice # 58682353
Address:
PO Box 1845
Jonesboro, AR 72403

You will also receive a final confirmation notice once the application has passed final review with the additional
payment details, but we wanted to keep you informed on the status of your request.

We appreciate your efforts 1o help people live better and wish you success.
Sincerely,

The Walmart Community Grants Team

CG/IMAIL/172088657
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