

BUDGET \$ 1,763.78

Date Opened November 1 84 84-28
 Opened By S.A. Kent
 Tabulated By B. Thompson

DIVISIONS				NAMES OF VENDORS				NAMES OF VENDORS															
Fire Department Uniforms (winter)				Lion Uniforms				Anderson's				Garment Corp of America				Farrior's				Martin-Southern Uniforms			
Art. Preference								X				X											
Sales Tax Permit No.																							
Amount																							
Item No.	Quantity	Description	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount	Unit Price	Amount					
		Trousers:			NO BID						NO BID												
47		with stripe				27.75	1,304.25			27.40	1,287.80	23.90	1,123.30*										
10		without stripe				24.75	247.75			25.90	259.00	22.05	220.50*										
		Shirts:																					
4		Long Sleeve-white-Tropical				20.25	81.00			21.15	84.60	23.55	94.20*										
51		Long Sleeve-white-Poplin				15.10	770.10			15.50	772.65	18.25	930.75*										
4		Long Sleeve-Blue-Poplin				15.10	60.40			15.50	60.60	18.25	73.00*										
		Patches:																					
4		Gold				2.00	8.00			1.75	7.00		NO BID										
55		Silver				2.00	110.00			1.75	96.25		NO BID										
		OVERSIZES:					10%				10%		10%										
TOTAL AMOUNT							2,581.50				2,567.90		2,441.75										
Cash Amount																							
Net Amount																							
Delivery																							

*Alt. - does not meet specs.